Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 25 November 2020 9:06 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Jasmine Tan; Claims

Subject: RE: offer; Our Ref: CC3/EQ17022869/Kga3-1; Your Ref: ADD1711-317 (Payment)
Attachments: Trans-cab Auto Giro Account.pdf

Without prejudice

Dear Cecilia
Account Name TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
Account Number 003-912894-0
Bank Name DBS BANK LTD
Bank & Branch Code 7171 & 003
Thank You
Best Regards,
Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct of
this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 24 November, 2020 4:07 PM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; Claims
<claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: offer; Our Ref: CC3/EQ17022869/Kga3-1; Your Ref: ADD1711-317 (Payment)

Importance: High

Without Prejudice
Hi Wai Yin,

Please be informed that EQ is moving into E-payment modes.



