Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

HI Taufikh

$6800 can ?

HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com>
Thursday, 26 November 2020 1:37 pm

Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Re: FBQ1533J REPAIR LIMIT

On Fri, Nov 20, 2020 at 12:36 PM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Keong,

Please take note repair limit for this bike is $5000.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

Get Outlook for Android

Thank You.

Best Regards

James Lim ( Keong )
Tel:*+65 9242 3895

BLK 1008 #01-24 Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722
Tel:+65 6275-6656, 6275-6566 Fax: 6272-9291



