Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 20 November 2020 5:07 pm
To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: FBQ1533J REPAIR LIMIT

MV $8500

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 20 November 2020 4:03 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: FBQ1533] REPAIR LIMIT

Hi Taufikh,

Please let me know the MV.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 20 November 2020 12:37 pm

To: HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com>
Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FBQ1533J REPAIR LIMIT

Hi Keong,

Please take note repair limit for this bike is $5000.
Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto
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