Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 November 2020 10:23 AM

To: service@kkimhin.com.sg; MT_Claim_SG; 'assignments@Ikkauto.com’; 'SUR'
Cc: Sandra (Gmail)

Subject: RE: Fwd: OD Lonpac (SMG 8289 R) (DOA: 13 Nov 2020) - veh in Our Ref:

20/20/20/VP05/023904 [External General]

Lonpac External - General

Dear Sandra

We are ok with it.

Dear LKK

fya

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse

Singapore 199555
TeL: (65_) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all TN |[onpac.com.sg

Experience It Mow

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: service [mailto:service@kkimhin.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 November 2020 9:23 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: Sandra (Gmail) <sandrakhong@gmail.com>; service@kkimhin.com.sg
Subject: re: Fwd: OD Lonpac (SMG 8289 R) (DOA: 13 Nov 2020) - veh in

Dear Officer

Good day to you.

We are in the midst of typing the estimate for SMG 8289 R for Own Damage Claim (Lonpac) which will be ready shortly.
Vehicle is in the workshop.

Please arrange for survey. Thank you.

Is it possible to arrange for LKK Kenneth as he will be coming to survey another vehicle?

Best Regards

Sandra

6452 7018

9622 2116
K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd



