Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 14 June 2021 5:51 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Admin A; CS A Team; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)

Cc: ‘Claims'

Subject: RE: LOD - FINAL REVISION - SJL3999S - OD CLAIMS X 2 - SURVEYED 17 NOV 20
Attachments: SJL 3999 S - AIG OD - 16112020.pdf

Dear Veron,

Attached LOD your perusal.

We seek to request acceptance of LOD and your process of settlement by email/soft copy at this stage due to delays
in submission of original documents to your good office. Should you need the original urgently and can only act upon
receipt, do acknowledge this email to let us know for our arrangement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Nadia Hani
Claims Administrator

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 m. +65 8826 8736

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

Find out more

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 10 May 2021 3:46 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com; Veron Chen <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Carrine Leong
<carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SJL3999S - OD CLAIMS X 2 - SURVEYED 17 NOV 20



Hi Taufikh and all,
Both revised estimates for separate accident is attached together with photographs.
Please confirm repair cost :

PA/OD/0873/2020/CCS - $2999.60 @ 3 DAYS
PA/OD/0875/2020//CCS - $8329.28 @ 5 DAYS

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



