Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 November, 2020 9:02 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto; SUR

Cc: Loganathan Agoram; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10007961/LA || OI- SJIQ5711R (Silver) TP- SLJ9580M ||
Est:0.00 || TK Motor

Attachments: SJQ5711R.pdf; SLJ9580M.pdf

Hi Team,

Good morning.
We would like to arrange TP PRS for SLJI9580M. TP chose Mr. Adrian Ling to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:

TK MOTOR WORKSHOP

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#02-56 AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Contact: Kenny/ 9627 3323

Please confirm. Thank you.

Regards,

Ivy Ratilla
Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853
E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg
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This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is
for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the
stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may
be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use,
interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 16 November 2020 5:26 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; lvy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Our Ref: L.20.0948.AT//Your ref: SJQ 5711R//PRS//Accident involving SLJ 9580M on 13.11.2020 | |
C10007961

Dear Sirs

Our client is agreeable to the following surveyor as the SJE: Adrian Ling (LKK AUTO CONSULTANT
PTE LTD)

Please arrange for your surveyor to survey our client's vehicle at the following address:

TK MOTOR WORKSHOP

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#02-56 AutoBay @Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Contact: Kenny/ 9627 3323

Please instruct your surveyor to conduct the pre-repair survey immediately and complete the pre-repair
survey within 2 working days of his appointment.

Kindly let us have the pre-repair and/or post repair survey report upon completion of the survey.

As solicitors on record, our client shall look to you for payment of our legal costs plus disbursements should
you reach a direct settlement with our client's repairer.

Regards
Anne
Kuru & Co

150 South Bridge Road
#04-06 Fook Hai Building
Singapore 058727

Tel: 6532 2009

Fax: 6532 2007

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended for the addressee(s) only and may contain confidential
information and/or may be subjected to legal privilege. If you have received in error, please notify us immediately by return
email, delete this message and you shall not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein.



From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 16 November 2020 4:37 PM

To: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Our Ref: L.20.0948.AT//Your ref: SJQ 5711R//PRS//Accident involving SLJ 9580M on 13.11.2020

Dear Sirs

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ 9580M & SJQ 5711R ON 13.11.2020
ALONG CANTONMENT CLOSE

NOTIFICATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

We act for Lim Chin Huat, whose vehicle registration number SLJ 9580M was damaged in the above
accident.

A copy of the Accident report filed is enclosed.

As as result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the
damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you
would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle.

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair
the vehicle without further reference to you.

Regards
Anne

Kuru & Co

150 South Bridge Road
#04-06 Fook Hai Building
Singapore 058727

Tel: 6532 2009

Fax: 6532 2007



CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended for the addressee(s) only and may contain confidential information
and/or may be subjected to legal privilege. If you have received in error, please notify us immediately by return email, delete
this message and you shall not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein.

This emalil is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte.
Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended
addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may
not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are
not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or
disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender
and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.
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