Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Importance:

Hi Jasper,

Don Bong Kiong Hua <kionghua.bong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Thursday, 26 November 2020 4:52 PM

Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Hizam HASHIM (ITE)

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJU 447R AND SKE 8118K ON 13/11/2020
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As spoken, attached scene photo as request.

Don Bong

Claim Division Operations
209 Pandan Gardens
Singapore 609339
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- .
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From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 26 November 2020 2:56 pm
To: Hizam HASHIM (ITE) <Hizam Hashim@ite.edu.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJU 447R AND SKE 8118K ON 13/11/2020

CAUTION:This email originated from outside of ITE Exchange Online. Do not click on links or attachments if you are unsure of

the source.

Dear Sir,

Can you kindly submit your vehicle’s camera video footage to us for our pursual.

Thanks



Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 November 2020 2:54 PM

To: hizam hashim@ite.edu.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJU 447R AND SKE 8118K ON 13/11/2020

Our Ref: CC6/AIG20012614/ba3
26 NOVEMBER 2020

HIZAM BIN HASHIM

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJU 447R AND SKE 8118K ON 13/11/2020

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized driver may

not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in
writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 06/12/2020, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant
on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against

the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will

be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd

and/or any of its related corporations.



