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Nur Syafiqah (LKKAuto)

From: Nur Syafiqah (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 18 November, 2016 7:12 PM

To: Susan Low

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Nur Syafiqah (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 4544D(AIG) & YL 4190Z ON 01/09/2016

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Your Ref: YL4190Z160901 
Our Ref: CC6/AIG16017980/Upa3 
  
Dear Susan, 
  
Accident involving SKG 4544D & YL 4190Z on 01/09/2016 
 

We refer to the email below.  

 

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions.  There is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either parties’ 

version. 

 

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client’s claim in the above matter 

without resort to litigation and not jeopardizing our insured claim against the liable party, we are prepared to offer 50% to your 

client’s claim. 

 
For a quick and amicable settlement, we offer to settle global sum at  S$ 1,450.00 
  
Kindly confirm acceptance. 
 

 

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Syaf | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-5792 | email: NurSyafiqah@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

SSSSave the Earth. Print only when necessary.ave the Earth. Print only when necessary.ave the Earth. Print only when necessary.ave the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the 

sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden. 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 27 October, 2016 11:39 AM 

To: 'Susan Low' <liusbro@ymail.com> 

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 4544D(AIG) & YL 4190Z ON 01/09/2016 

 

Your ref: YL 4190Z                                    Without Prejudice 
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Our ref: CC6/AIG16017980/Upa3 

 

Dear Sir, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 4544D(AIG) & YL 4190Z ON 01/09/2016 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence yet to 

substantiate either party’s version. Kindly refer to the attached statement for your easy reference. 

 

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client’s claim in 

the above matter without resort to litigation and not jeopardizing our insured claim against the liable party, 

we are prepared to offer 50% towards your client’s claim. 

 

Kindly revert. 
 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 


