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Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 Auto Bay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883 

ROC No: 42674600K Email: liusbro@ymail.com

Tel: 6741-1730/ 1731 . Fax: 6744-5746.

Our Ref: YL4190Z160901 Date: 20/10/2020

Your Ref:

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way #07-16
AIG Building
Singapore 079120
Motor Claims Department

Dear Sirs,

RE Traffic Accident Along TANGLIN HALT ROAD  
Involving: YL4190Z and SKG4544D On: 01/09/2016

We refer to the above matter and your / our letter / dated 27/04/2018

 We had enclosed the duly signed discharge voucher (s) for your necessary action.

XZf We have yet to receive your favorable response I payment towards our client claims.

 Please let us have your cheque for the sum of S$ made in our favour WITHIN 7 DAYS.

 Kindly let us hear from you in respect of our clients’ claim as soon as possible.

 We would appreciate it if you could review this matter. We regret we are unable to accept yours offer. We counter 

propose f your offer as follow settlement:-

CORSs  LOUS$ (S$  X Days) GIA/LTA SF S$ = S$

We hereby confirm acceptance of your offer. Kindly let us have your discharge voucher for our client’s execution and 

your cheque made in our favour as soon as possible.

 yye regret that despite reasonable effort having been made to settle our clients’ claim, there does not appear to be 
prospects of settlement. We hereby give you 07 days’ notice that our client will have no alternative but to commence 

proceedings legal action against you or yours insured without further notice to you or yours insured.

 Note/Remark:- 

Yours faithfully,

A
M/s Liu’s Bro Auto Engrg Ws

Mdm. Susan Low

I F
X

I
I CL No.

DECEIVED BY AIG
Claims Dept

2 2 OCT 2020

(O3o1?i7'piJn<rj I
I Team ir .adj --------------------

I
_________________ ________________ ____ 1



Dei.ot
i a^v i t

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 4544D(AIG) & YL 4190Z ON 01/09/2016

From: Susan Low (liusbro@ymail com)

To: chewht@lkkauto.com;

Date: Friday, 27 April 2018, 10:31

We hereby confirm acceptance of your offer 8$ 1,450.00 (50:50)

Kindly let us have your discharge for our client's execution and your cheque made in our favour as soon as possible

Thank.

Best Regards,

Susan Low
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
To: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 4 September 2017, 10:50
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 4544D(AIG) & YL 4190Z ON 01/09/2016

Without Prejudice

Hi.

We refer to our email dated 18/11/2016.

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Kindly d«,. tbi. panl„ on this Is X’
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedmgs. No admiss.on of liability, whatsoever, snouio o 

negotiation of terms/settlement.
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materialiy affectfinfluence on the issues of 

liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlemen

Best Regards.

Hsiao Tong. Chew > Case Handler

l,KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 ; email: I 6x: <>741-4108

Blk Sl.Paya I bi Industrial Park, l.'bi Avenue 1, -02-25 : S(408933)

From: Nur Syafiqah (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 18 November, 2016 7:12 PM

£ Ad“"n a“ Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) sct^eikkauto com.; Not Syahqah (LKKAuto)

^X^fcS^OLVtNG SKG 45440^0) 8 YL 4190Z ON 01/09/2016

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

https://mail.yahoo.com/?.intl=en&.lang-en-SG&.partner-none&.src fp 27-Apr-18



ranoo Man - Our Ret: YL4190Z160901 Your Ref: CC6/AIG160.
liltps://irail.vahoo.coin/d/foldcrs/2/incssagc&/ALc7Whc60>ls.X'K

Our Ref: YL4190Z160901 Your Ref: CC6/AIG16017980/Upa3

From: Susan Low (liusbro@ymail.com)

To: chewht@lkkauto.com

Date: Friday, 5 April 2019, 5:28 pm SGT

We refer to our attachment.

Kindly arrange to let us have the DV ASAP.

Thank.

Best Regards,

Susan Low
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746
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