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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Christina <christina@1ap.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 20 May 2021 3:14 PM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: GBK 5973 - Finalize

Importance: High

Dear Steve, 
 
We confirm COR @ $3500 and DOR @ 5 days. 
 
We’ll forward our LOD to China Taiping in due course. 
 
Thanks and best regards, 
Christina Tan 
Business Development Manager 
1st Auto Pro Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 Premier @ Kaki Bukit 
Office @ #01-49     |     Ws @ #01-51 & 52 
Singapore 415875     |     DID: 9188 3197 
 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, April 21, 2021 9:32 PM 
To: christina@1ap.com.sg 
Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: GBK 5973 - Finalize 
 
Hi Chris, 
 
Kindly refer our finalize $3500 (L/S, before GST). 5 repair days. 
 
Kindly confirm. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Thanks. 
 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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