
11/17/2020 Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/deeplink?version=20201109002.09&popoutv2=1 1/1

 Reply all  Delete  Junk Block

Re: SKJ 1800T DOA : 07/11/2020

Tue 17/11/2020 8:44 AM

without prejudice. 

Dear Kerlyn,

Rasul is on leave, i have check with Rasul limit repair at 10k.

Thanks and regards,
Denise
Case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: ' 62563561 Fax: 6 6256 4315
Email: + sur@lkkauto.com

From: Kerlyn Ong <kerlyn.ong@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, 17 November 2020 7:48 AM 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Cheong Chin Leong
<chinleong.cheong@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SKJ 1800T DOA : 07/11/2020
 
Hi Rasul,
 
As per our calculation, the repair limit should be around 10K.
 
Can please re-adjust?
 
 
Your Sincerely, 

Kerlyn Ong 
Service Advisor - Body Care & Repair 
Mercedes-Benz Body Care & Repair Center
Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd  
188 Pandan Loop Service Center  
Mobile: 91865113 | DID: 67714420 | Fax: 68721272 
Website: www.mercedes-benz.com.sg
 
From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, 16 November, 2020 7:04 PM 
To: Kerlyn Ong 
Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) 
Subject: SKJ 1800T DOA : 07/11/2020
 
This email was sent from outside of your organisation

DT
Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

    

To:  Kerlyn Ong <kerlyn.ong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Rasul (LKKAuto)
Cc:  Cheong Chin Leong <chinleong.cheong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>


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