11/16/2020 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Claim Docs - Third Party Claim for damage on SLB3011X

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Mon 16/11/2020 10:05 AM
To: Guo Yong EE (ICA) <EE_Guo_Yong@ica.gov.sg>

U 1 attachments (2 MB)
SLB 3011_Surveyor Marking.pdf;

Dear Mr Ee,

GBH9882X(ICA) -> SLB3011X(3rd Party) -> SKG3248R -> SKK4333A

- This is a 4 vehicles chain collision whereby ICA vehicle is the last car. Liability is not in our driver's favour.
- Attached is a copy of surveyor marking based on 3rd party survey report for your reference.

- We have adjusted claim amount as below to offer 3rd party lawyer;

- For your approval please.

“Your Ref: AL.INS.2020.30117(PD)JW WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our Ref: CS3/ICA20009978/Ep-1

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 9882X / SLB 3011X/ OTHERS ON 12/09/2020
We have been appointed by ICA as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving ICA vehicles.

Strictly without admission of liability and for quick and amicable settlement, our principal ICA is prepared to settle
your client's claim as follows :-

1. Cost of Repair $ 16,300.00
2. Loss of Rental (12days x $150.00) S 1,800.00
3. Towing Fee S 120.00
4. Survey Report Fee S 1,200.00
5. LTA Search Fee Subject to receipt/invoice
6. Cost & Incidentals S 900.00

Total $20,320.00

Please confirm acceptance.”

Please let me know if you have any queries.

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 November 2020 3:39 PM

To: Guo Yong EE (ICA) <EE_Guo_Yong@ica.gov.sg>

Subject: Re: Claim Docs - Third Party Claim for damage on SLB3011X

Hi Mr Ee,
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 12/11/2020.
We will handle the matter accordingly.

Thanks.

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Guo Yong EE (ICA) <EE_Guo_Yong@ica.gov.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 12 November 2020 3:32 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Claim Docs

Message Classification: Restricted
Hsiao Tong

Pls refer to attached for assistance, and use the password send earlier to open the LOD.
Thanks.

Ee Guo Yong

Senior Transport and Logistics Executive
Corporate Services Div

DID: (65) 6391 6566

HOME TEAM

+ *TRANSFORMATION 2025 ¢ #®
-

« One Home, One Team
. Building Our Future Together

Immigration & Checkpoints Authority W ica.gov.sg FB fb.com/Immigration.Checkpoints.Authority

https://outlook.office.com/mail/deeplink?version=20201109002.09&popoutv2=1 2/3



11/16/2020 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must
not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email fo any unauthorised
person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error."
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