Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: jerdine.wang@alp.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, 30 December 2020 3:36 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); jiamin.mak@alp.com.sg; vincent.er@alp.com.sg;
allister@alp.com.sg

Subject: RE: [REMINDER] RE: Your Ref: AL.INS.2020.30117(PD)JW // Our Ref:

CS3/1CA20009978/Ep-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 9882X / SLB 3011X/ OTHERS
ON 12/09/2020]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We refer to your email below.

We have instructions to accept the offer of $19,969.00 for the property damage claim only.
Kindly let us have your clients’ dv urgently.

Thank you.

Please NOTE that I have moved to ALP LAW CORPORATION.

Best Regards
Jerdine

For and on behalf of
ALLISTER LIM

ALP LAW CORPORATION
ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS

1 Coleman Street
#05-01 The Adelphi
Singapore 179803
DID: 6422 2187
Telephone : 6438 3303
Facsimile : 6438 1211

Email Confidentiality Warning:
This message contains information which is subject to legal professional privilege and/or is confidential. If you are not the intended

recipient, you are notified that any unauthorised disclosure, copying, distribution or use of this information is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this message in error, please notify us by e-mailing us at [ mail@alp.com.sg ] and delete it from your system. Unless
the contents of this email relate to matters within the scope of the firm’s engagement, any opinions, views and other information are
expressed in the sender’s personal capacity. You should scan this email and any file attached for viruses. We take no responsibility
for any loss or damage, whether caused by our own negligence or not, that results from a computer virus or a defect in the
transmission of this email or any attached file.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 23 December 2020 4:44 PM



To: jerdine.wang@alp.com.sg

Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; jiamin.mak@alp.com.sg; vincent.er@alp.com.sg;
allister@alp.com.sg

Subject: RE: [REMINDER] RE: Your Ref: AL.INS.2020.30117(PD)JW // Our Ref: CS3/ICA20009978/Ep-1 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING GBH 9882X / SLB 3011X/ OTHERS ON 12/09/2020]

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Jerdine,
We refer to your below email.

We are prepared to revise our offer as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair $ 16,000.00
2. Loss of Rental (12days x $140.00) S 1,680.00
3. Towing Fee S 120.00
4. Survey Report Fee S 1,200.00
5. LTA Search Fee S 169.00
6. Cost & Incidentals S 800.00

Total | $19,969.00

Please confirm acceptance.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: jerdine.wang@alp.com.sg <jerdine.wang@alp.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 December 2020 3:42 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; jiamin.mak@alp.com.sg; vincent.er@alp.com.sg;
allister@alp.com.sg

Subject: [REMINDER] RE: Your Ref: AL.INS.2020.30117(PD)JW // Our Ref: CS3/ICA20009978/Ep-1 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING GBH 9882X / SLB 3011X/ OTHERS ON 12/09/2020]

Importance: High

Dear Sir,

Please let us have your reply to our email below urgently.



Thank you.

Please NOTE that I have moved to ALP LAW CORPORATION.

Best Regards
Jerdine

For and on behalf of
ALLISTER LIM

ALP LAW CORPORATION
ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS

1 Coleman Street
#05-01 The Adelphi
Singapore 179803
DID: 6422 2187
Telephone : 6438 3303
Facsimile : 6438 1211

Email Confidentiality Warning:
This message contains information which is subject to legal professional privilege and/or is confidential. If you are not the intended

recipient, you are notified that any unauthorised disclosure, copying, distribution or use of this information is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this message in error, please notify us by e-mailing us at [ mail@alp.com.sg ] and delete it from your system. Unless
the contents of this email relate to matters within the scope of the firm’s engagement, any opinions, views and other information are
expressed in the sender’s personal capacity. You should scan this email and any file attached for viruses. We take no responsibility
for any loss or damage, whether caused by our own negligence or not, that results from a computer virus or a defect in the
transmission of this email or any attached file.

From: jerdine.wang@alp.com.sg <jerdine.wang@alp.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 17 December 2020 12:25 PM

To: 'chewht@lkkauto.com' <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'olivialau@lkkauto.com' <olivialau@Ikkauto.com>; 'jiamin.mak@alp.com.sg' <jiamin.mak@alp.com.sg>;
'vincent.er@alp.com.sg' <vincent.er@alp.com.sg>; 'allister@alp.com.sg' <allister@alp.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: AL.INS.2020.30117(PD)JW // Our Ref: CS3/ICA20009978/Ep-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH
9882X / SLB 3011X/ OTHERS ON 12/09/2020]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir,
We refer to your email below.

We have instructions to propose settlement as follows:

1. Cost of Repair (midway) $ 19,000.00
2. Loss of Rental (12days x $160.00) S 1,920.00
3. Towing Fee S 120.00
4. Survey Report Fee S 1,200.00
5. LTA/ GIA/ Police Search Fee (proof attached) | $  169.00
6. Cost & Incidentals S 900.00

Total | $ 23,309.00
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Kindly let us have your clients’ favourable reply urgently.

Thank you.

Please NOTE that I have moved to ALP LAW CORPORATION.

Best Regards
Jerdine

For and on behalf of
ALLISTER LIM

ALP LAW CORPORATION
ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS

1 Coleman Street
#05-01 The Adelphi
Singapore 179803
DID: 6422 2187
Telephone : 6438 3303
Facsimile : 6438 1211

Email Confidentiality Warning:

This message contains information which is subject to legal professional privilege and/or is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any unauthorised disclosure, copying, distribution or use of this information is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this message in error, please notify us by e-mailing us at [ mail@alp.com.sg ] and delete it from your system. Unless
the contents of this email relate to matters within the scope of the firm’s engagement, any opinions, views and other information are
expressed in the sender’s personal capacity. You should scan this email and any file attached for viruses. We take no responsibility
for any loss or damage, whether caused by our own negligence or not, that results from a computer virus or a defect in the
transmission of this email or any attached file.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: 15 December 2020 12:42 PM

To: mail@alp.com.sg

Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref: AL.INS.2020.30117(PD)JW // Our Ref: CS3/ICA20009978/Ep-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 9882X
/ SLB 3011X/ OTHERS ON 12/09/2020]

Your Ref: AL.INS.2020.30117(PD)JW WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our Ref: CS3/ICA20009978/Ep-1

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 9882X / SLB 3011X/ OTHERS ON 12/09/2020
We have been appointed by ICA as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving ICA vehicles.

Strictly without admission of liability and for quick and amicable settlement, our principal ICA is prepared to settle
your client's claim as follows :-

1. Cost of Repair $ 15,000.00
2. Loss of Rental (12days x $120.00) S 1,440.00
3. Towing Fee S 120.00

4



4. Survey Report Fee

$ 1,200.00

5. LTA Search Fee

Subject to receipt/invoice

6. Cost & Incidentals

$ 800.00

Total

$18,560.00

Please confirm acceptance.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

Virus-free. www.avast.com




