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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 February 2021 12:38 PM

To: shery.wong@sg.gaig.com

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: GAIG ref:CLMOMVP000001108, ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SKV 5005
H & SGF 11 D ON 06/11/2020 @ 14:20

Attachments: PRELI ADVISE pdf

Dear Shery,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKV 5005H
Date of survey: 12/11/2020
Number of days (estimated) : 8 days

Best Regards,
Celine Fong
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 November 2020 5:00 PM

To: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>;
assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Chew, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Chew@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: Re: GAIG ref:CLMOMVP0O00001108, ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SKV 5005 H & SGF 11 D ON
06/11/2020 @ 14:20

Without Prejudice

Dear Wendy,

Noted on your request, we will survey on a without prejudice basis.

Aside to LKK,
Please accept assignment for TP survey.

Thank you.

For all first claim notifications on Property & Casualty Claims (excluding Motor claims), please email to

GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com
For motor claims enquiries, please email to motorclaims@sg.gaig.com

1



! Fj Fj g—:.:)gsuﬂanls

- : ; -J:l Pio Ltd Company Registration No. 199607198R
S1URIAVE 1, #02.25 PAYA UBTLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315
Your Ref: CLMOMVP000001108 Date: 04 February 2021

Our Ref: CS/GAI20012438/Acf3

The Motor Claims Department
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVISE REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SKV 5005H

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle on
12/11/2020 at the premises of M/s Kai Motor Trading and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 13.321.52 ;
Revised Estimate Amount :S$  7.550.00 (Lump Sum) .
“Check” Items Amount . S% -
Market Value : S$ -
LTA Reimbursement Value :S$ -
Nett Value : S§ -

Description of Damage: ——

The vehicle sustained damages o —
at the n/s body & undercarriage. front
Comments/ Present Status: Offvide

Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 8 days
Yours faithfully

Adrian Ling
Automotive Assessor



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 13 Nov 2020

Singapore NRIC
024)

SKV5005H

No

13 Nov 2020
HONDA

VEZEL 1.5XCVT
White

2015
L15B4021263
RU11101262
96.0 kW (128 bhp)
$18,410.00

04 Sep 2015

04 Sep 2015

0

$8,410.00

Yes
03 Sep 2025
$5,887.00

03 Sep 2025

A -Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)

10

$58,700.00
$28,215.00
$34,102.00
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Used vezel Cars | Singapore Car Prices & Listing - sgCarMart

Honda Vezel 1.5A X Honda $51,888 $9,670 /yr 02-Oct-2015 1,496 cc 68,577 km Suv
Sensing

1 Owner Only! Pearl White SUV. Pristine And Well Maintain Interior! Comes With 16' Sport Rims! Immaculate Condition! Various Loan

Schemes Available Including Bank And In-House Loan With High Approval Rate, Trade In Welcome! Call Our Friendly Sales Rep To Arran...

Posted: 07-Nov-2020 Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, Honda Vezel, Honda, Vezel

Honda Vezel 1.5A X Honda $51,800 $9,650 /yr 06-Oct-2015 1,496 cc 52,910 km SWV
Sensing

1 Unit Owner! Come With New 6 Month Road Tax! Low Mileage! With New Paintwork! Mast Popular Compact SUV! Excellent Fuel
Efficiency! Spacious Leg Room Coupled With Large Boot Space! Bank/In House Loan Available. Call Us Today And Grab The Car Away N...

Posted: D6-Nov-2020 Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, Honda Vezel, Honda, Vezel

Honda Vezel 1.5A X $47,800 $8,830 /yr 08-Oct-2015 1,496 cc 114,000 km SWV

Non PHV Unit! Owner Is Upgrading Hence Selling! The Honda Vezel Is One Of The Best Fuel-efficient Cars In Singapore! Not Only You Get
To Enjoy Massive Savings On Fuel, But The Huge Space In The Cabin Also Makes Sure That Your Family Travels In Comfort! Fuel Efficie...

Car Buyers Automotive Pte Ltd
Posted: 12-Nov-2020 Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, Honda Vezel, Honda, Vezel

Used Cars with sgCarMart Warranty!

Buy a used car with sgCarMart Warranty. 188-point check. Service your car anywhere yet still get 100% assurance on claims. Pay $0 for High Quality

Repairs, Get your sgCarMart Warranty car now.

Find out more!

Honda Vezel 1.5A X $49,888 $9,140 /yr 16-Oct-2015 1,496 cc 59,478 km Suv

1 Owner, Amazing Low Mileage Done 59000km With Full-Service Records. Comes With 4 New Tyres Always Sheltered Parked At Totally
Under-Utilized Condition! Totally Like New, See To Fall In Love 100% Accident-Free. Be Assured Tts Non-Private Hire/Leasing Car. Call N...

Posted: 12-Nov-2020 Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, Honda Vezel, Honda, Vezel

Honda Vezel 1.5A X $47,888 $8,740 [yr 22-Oct-2015 1,496 cc 85,647 km Suv

1 Owner! Pearl White With Brawn Brown Interior! Nice Car Plate To Go With The Car Too! Comes With 17" OZ Rims With New Tires!
Immaculate Conditions! View To Believe! Genuine Mileage! Car Not Under PHV! Is Ex Owner Personal And Family Car! 6 Months Warrant..

Posted: 10-Sep-2020 Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, Honda Vezel, Honda, Vezel

Honda Vezel 1.5A X Honda $50,800 $9,240 Jyr 28-Oct-2015 1,496 cc 47,000 km Suv
Sensing

100% Loan Available With Low-Interest Rate. Low Mileage, No Repairs Needed, Car Like New, Flexible Loan Provided, High-Value Trade
In Available, STA/VICOM/Own Workshop Pre-Purchase Evaluation Welcomed. Kindly Call Us Now For More Information. Book A Test Dri...

EDM Cars Pte Ltd
Posted: 06-Nov-2020 Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, Honda Vezel, Honda, Vezel

Honda Vezel 1.5A X $51,800 $9,530 /yr 30-Oct-2015 1,496 cc 78,000 km Suv

Flegant Silver SUV, One Owner Only, Low Maintenarice Cost, Very Well Maintained, Easy Financing, Flexible In House Loan Available. Call
Our Friendly Sale Consultant Now Before It's Gone!

Starise Automobile
Posted: 29-Oct-2020  Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, Honda Vezel, Honda, Vezel

Honda Vezel 1.5A X $51,800 $9,410 /yr 11-Nov-2015 1,496 cc 67,600 km suv

Promo 1.88% Bank Loan Interest Rate, Flexible In House Loan Available. 1 Owner Unit. Non PHV/GRAB/Uber/Rental Car. Low Mileage
Done. Most Popular Compact SUV, Original Well Maintain Condition & Paint Work. ARF $9631, Bank Loan/In House Loan Available. Trad...

Posted: 06-Nov-2020 Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, Honda Veze', Honda, Vezel

Honda Vezel 1.5AX $49,888 $8,990 /yr 16-Nav-2015 1,496 cc = Suv

Most Popular Compact SUV, Well Taken Care, Flexi Loan Available At 2.28% Interest Rates, This Unit Comes With A 1 Year Extended
Warranty By Our Workshop, Please Contact Our Sale Consultant For More Information.

Posted: 29-Oct-2020 Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, Honda Vezel, Honda, Vezel

Honda Vezel 1.5A X $49,800 $9,000 /yr 20-Nov-2015 1,496 cc 58,111 km Suv

100% Loan Available, Auto Tail-Gate, Vehicle Fully Done Up In Showroom Condition With Brand New Paint Coat. Premium Groeming
Before Handing Over. Confident Buying From A sgCarMart Premium Dealer! No Waiting, Immediate Delivery. Feel Free To Contact Us Fa...

laxis
Posted: 06-Nov-2020 Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, Honda Vezel, Honda, Vezel

Honda Vezel 1.5A X $51,000 $9,230 /yr 23-Nov-2015 1,496 cc 70,800 km SUV

Ein~~-+ Black SUV, One Owner Only, This Is Not A Rental / Limousine Unit, Genuine Low Mileage, Low Maintenance Cost, Very Well
sed, Easy Financing, Flexible In-House Loan Packages Available.

lotor & Leasing

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?ORD=RG D_ASC&MOD=vezel&RPG=20&VEH=0&RGD=201 58AVL=2

Available

Available

PREMIUM AD

Available

Available

| PREMIUM AD

Available

Available

PREMIUM AD

Available

Available

Available

Available

Available
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MNII20098130 / NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd - HQ
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 06/11/2020 16:16
SUBMITTED BY: Tang Chun Kiet

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to

repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee. be made available upon application by interested parties.
7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers. you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available

aforesaid.

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

06/11/2020 16:16

06/11/2020 14:20

X JUNCTION JALAN ISHAK & LORONG MARICAN
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vehicle Registration Number SKV5005H
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner RAJNI MOHAN MULANI
NRIC No §2220024J
Email Address NOEMAIL

Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

(LOCAL) +65-96677479
OTHERS-96356385

HONDA
VEZEL

LEISURE

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

5073536003-05

DRIVO CLASSIC

GIRESH MOHAN MULANI
S9412375E

05/04/1994

INDOOR

10/02/2015

5 YEARS AND 8 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-96356385

NOEMAIL

Page 1 of 14



Address

Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)

Passenger 1

Passenger 2

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?

If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

Refer to sketch plan

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?
Remarks/ Reasons:

Was there any audio recorded?

6 TAMAN SIGLAP

455668
NO

CHILDREN

COLLISION - CROSS JUNCTION

CLEAR
DRY

NO
2
NO
NO
YES
NO
3

NAME:

GENDER:

NAME:

GENDER:

NO

NO

YES
YES

: PASSENGER
: MALE

: PASSENGER
: FEMALE

FILES SIZE TOO BIG TO BE UPLOADED

NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

SGF11D

PRIVATE CAR

ENG CHOR WAH

S1109718l

96731202

Page 2 of 14



Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage G(faf- Amr/’rf-e‘,ﬂ (’ 8 04' ﬁ(/*’ 0
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver) 2 f, m‘a‘\m 8@87 . Eﬁl\-ﬁ .Coni
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Sketch Plan Pg. 1

INCOME MOTOR SERVICE CENTRE Report Dawe & Start Time: 061120200 16:07

Report NooMT_ D.O.A: 06/11/2020 Vehicle No SKVS00SH  Reporting Type:
Time: 14:20 hrs

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctiy the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material
facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapare (G!A) for archiving and that copies of this report will for 2 fee be made available upon application by
interested parties.

7. By the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of
the report being made available aforesaid.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act {PDPA}
I understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

{a} My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore (“GIA") may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out in this [form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer {collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident (all insurer(s} who have insured
vehicle(s} invoived in this accident shall be coliectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the

s Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s)
of :

(i} processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

(i) investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(iii) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

(iv) administering my claims (including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices tc me,
which could invelve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

{v) complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.{collectively the
“Purposes”)

(b) allinsurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

(c} my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agents{including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes.

(d} my Personal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and all future claims.

(e} the information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

(i} toallinsurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

{ii} for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

Alan Tang (S098825)
Customer Care Executive w
06/11/20/ 16:07 M@g?i 06/11/20/ 16:07 Motor Service Centre

Policyhoider's §ignature / Date & Time t ature (if driver is not the policyholder) / Date & Time Withessea by Reporting Centre Peronnel

Page 4 of 14



Sketch Plan Pg. 2

SKETCH PLAN

Lorong Marican

-

Jalan Ishak

Vehicle A: SKV3005H Vehicle B: SGF11D

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
[ was travelling straight ahead along Jalan Ishak. When crossing the cross junction of junction Jalan Ishak & Lorong Marican,

suddenly, vehicle B dashed out from Lorong Marican, from my left and did not stop before the stop line. This resulted in the front of

vehicle B to hit into the left side of my vehicle A.

Declaration
I/'We declare the foregoing particulars are true in every respect.
Alan Tang (S098825)
Customer Care Executive W
06/11/20/ 16:07 Motor Service Centre
Witnessed by Reporting Centre Personnel

06/11/20/ 16:07

Policyholder's Signature / Dale & Time

Driver's Signature (If driver is not the policyholder) / Date & Time

Page 5 of 14
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KAI MOTOR TRADING

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-440, SINGAPORE 408701.
TEL: 6747 4006 FAX: 6743 7591 EMAIL: kaimotor@gmail.com
BUS. REG. NO: 44223100L GST NO: M30371531Y

‘L
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Specialist in: Accidents Insurance Claim, Towing Service, Motor Vehicle Repairing, Panel Beating, Spray Painting.

Attn: The Motor Claims Department
Your Insured veh no : SGF 11 D

Great American Insurance Company (By Email Only)

Address: 3 Temasek Ave, Singapore 039190,

Phone: 6804 6000 68047845 sharon
motarclaims@sg.gaig.com

Dear Sir / Madam

Estimated cost of repair for venicle SKV 5005 H & SGF 11 D ON 06/11/2020 @ 14:20
To Supply:-

1pc Front Fender 7 h+(\
1pc Front Fender Inner Cowling +(u
1pc Front Fender Garnish LH 7 LA
1pc Front Head Lamp LH e (—a
1pc Front Bumper i ¢ .
1pc Front Bumper Lower Garnish V< LJ—A
10pcs  Front Bumper Clips P _ S5pcs S 5.00
1pc Front Bumper Side Retainer Lh ?”jd
1pc Front Shock Absorber LH B
1pc Front Shock Absorber Mounting LH #~ ¢~
1pc Front Shock Absorber Bearing LH it =
1pc Front Knuckle Arm LH ?")d
1pc Front Knuckle Arm Bearing LH <~
1pc Front Lower Arm LH Pert™
1pc Tie Rod LH Be r
1pc Front Drive Shaftd LH N«
1pc Front Brake Sensor LH 2 gl , Y h
1pc Front Brake Hose LH | ™
1pc Front Absorber Linkit ! rf & »
1ipc Front Door LH el d = 19
1pc Front Door Hniged Top LH it
1pc Front Door Hinge Lower LH 3% SN v Y % 0
1pc Rear DoorlH -t ik -
lpc Rear Door Hnige e
1pc Rear Fender Side Garnish TE&% Ck
lpc Front Spot Rim L ,
1pe Front LH Side Skirt Garnish T {8
1pc Front Door Inner Rubber 7 8
1pc Rear Door Inner Rubber IH =
0 o)
Less 20% j,%\ \'0
/
To dismanite & replace damage parts,panel beat where necessary .
To putty,apply primer & spray paint on the affecte portlon e ( /JLL.: b
To remove uphdstery -ﬂ ) e ‘f - 7 . e
To computer wheel aligment f f‘)5 J“}“ 20
To check wiring functions. o C‘(‘) o X
To remove under Carriage parts _ L«j 0 5 ﬂ‘r
! ‘ > : / L. ¢
b1~ LS

wr (1 n

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

RPN U A ¥ e P ¥ Y Y R Y R W R ¥ R

AT R ¥ R Vs Y Y RV R R ¥ R T R T R VA Vo NV, S

" 405.20
+~"104.90

— 157.60
7869.00

«— 864.20
—~ 204.60
3° sg10
«— 19.90
17360.70

~ 41.40

X 31.40
t—249.90

©-141.80
©—291.60
77520

A 1,253.50
4+ 158.60
+ 70.80

+ 5850

" 855.50
~~ 52.00
~ 52,00

493520
-+ 5140
" 17210

# 5»/9)—4917:@

-~ 395.00
- 265.00

$ 4+ 265.00

10,269.40
2,053.88

L7 VAR VR VA VR VO

8,215 5

%%?\

S—U
20

3-10‘31':’6’.‘00

12,095.52
13,351,562
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KAI MOTOR TRADING

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-440, SINGAPORE 408701.
TEL: 8747 4006 FAX: 6743 7591 EMAIL: kaimotor@gmail.com
BUS. REG. NO: 44223100L  GST NO: M90371531Y
FEBAS AL TN RGREE - E e, MNP ERESRAS 7757 h k-

Specialist in: Accidents Insurance Claim, Towing Service, Motor Vehicle Repairing, Panel Beating, Spray Painting.

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : SGF 11 D

Great American Insurance Company (By Email Only)
Address: 3 Temasek Ave, Singapore 035130,

Phone: 6804 6000 68047845 sharon

motorclaims@sg.gaig.com

Dear Sir / Madam

Supplementary Cost of repair To for vehicle SKV 5005 H & SGF 11 D ON 06/11/2020 @ 14:20

To Supply :-

1pc Steering Rack e s 1,226.90 —
1pc Antiroll Bar Be b s 206.30 —
1pc Anti Roll Bar link 8«1 S 74,10 —
1pc Fender Inner Garnish Q¢ ¢t S 25.20 =

s 1,532.50

less 20% -5 245.38

5 1,287.12

q
\ l s

7_]]},11\}\9/\_* ; " ‘_; J /O -

% i &=

/

/.



