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Summer Lee  (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 November, 2020 5:00 PM

To: Kai Motor; 'Summer Lee  (LKK Auto)'; 'SUR'; 'assignments@lkkauto.com'

Cc: Chew, Elizabeth

Subject: Re: GAIG ref:CLMOMVP000001108, ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SKV 5005 

H & SGF 11 D ON 06/11/2020 @ 14:20

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Wendy, 

 

Noted on your request, we will survey on a without prejudice basis. 

 

 

 

Aside to LKK, 

Please accept assignment for TP survey.  

Thank you. 

 

 

For all first claim notifications on Property & Casualty Claims (excluding Motor claims), please email to 

GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com 

 

For motor claims enquiries, please email to motorclaims@sg.gaig.com 

 

For all first claim notifications on Marine Claims, please email to marineclaims@sg.gaig.com 

 

Regards 

Shery Wong, Executive, Claims |  P. +65 68046077 | F. +65 62353354 | shery.wong@sg.gaig.com 

Claims| 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190  

 

For more information on our financial ratings, visit GAIG.com/FinancialStrength. 
 
 

Thank you for your trust in us. We're proud to continue to serve you during this unprecedented 

time. As COVID-19 continues to affect us all, we assure you that we remain committed to providing 

the high level of service you deserve. Read more. 

 

 

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>  

Sent: 12 November 2020 10:52 AM 

To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com> 
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Subject: [External] Re: GAIG ref:CLMOMVP000001108, ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SKV 5005 H & SGF 11 D 

ON 06/11/2020 @ 14:20 

 

Dear Shery wong, 

 

Thanks for your email. 

 

We select  LKK Auto Consultants for this case. 

 
Thank you. 

 
With regards, 

 
Wendy  

 

On Wed, 11 Nov 2020 at 17:07, Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs, 

We append the following list of our panel surveyors:- 

1.       AJAX Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd 

2.       A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte. Ltd. 

3.       Priority Services 

4.       RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 

5.       LKK Auto Consultants  

Kindly let us know which SJE is selected and furnish the estimates for the survey to be carried out. 

  

For all first claim notifications on Property & Casualty Claims (excluding Motor claims), please email to 

GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com 

  

For motor claims enquiries, please email to motorclaims@sg.gaig.com 

  

For all first claim notifications on Marine Claims, please email to marineclaims@sg.gaig.com 

  

Regards 

Shery Wong, Executive, Claims |  P. +65 68046077 | F. +65 62353354 | shery.wong@sg.gaig.com 
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Claims| 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190  

 

For more information on our financial ratings, visit GAIG.com/FinancialStrength. 

  

  

Thank you for your trust in us. We're proud to continue to serve you during this unprecedented 

time. As COVID-19 continues to affect us all, we assure you that we remain committed to providing 

the high level of service you deserve. Read more. 

  

  

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>  

Sent: 11 November 2020 3:56 PM 

To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com> 

Subject: [External] RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SKV 5005 H & SGF 11 D ON 06/11/2020 @ 14:20 

  

         

    
KAI  MOTOR  TRADING

    

    BLK 3007  UBI  ROAD 1     

    #01-440, SINGAPORE 408701     

    TEL: 67474006   FAX:67437591     

    E-mail : kaimotor@gmail.com      

    REG NO: 44223100L     

    
 

    

Date : 11/11/2020   
 

    

         
Attn: The Motor Claims Department    WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Your Insured veh no : SGF 11 D        

Great American Insurance Company    (By Email Only)  
Address:Address:Address:Address:    3 Temasek Ave, Singapore 039190,3 Temasek Ave, Singapore 039190,3 Temasek Ave, Singapore 039190,3 Temasek Ave, Singapore 039190,         

Phone:Phone:Phone:Phone:    6804 60006804 60006804 60006804 6000 68047845sharon       

motorclaims@sg.gaig.com         

         
Dear Sir / Madam        

         
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SKV 5005 H & SGF 11 D ON 06/11/2020 @ 14:20  

         
We  are writing  on  behalf  of MS. RAJNI MOHAN MULANI  the registered owner   
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of SKV 5005 H which was involved on the above mentioned accident between SGF 11 D. 

         
Investigation reveals that the motor vehicle number  SGF 11 D was insured with you at the  

material time of the said accident.      
 

        
As  a result of the accident  was  caused  solely  and  completely  by  the  negligence  of  your  

insured  vehicle number  SGF 11 D.  Therefore, our client is holding you liable for the repair  

costs and other consequential loss which was sustained by him/her/them.  

         
Kindly  arrange  your representative  to  survey  our client’s v ehicle at  KAI MOTOR TRADING  

Blk 3007, Ubi Road 1, #01-440, Singapore 408701 within two (2) days from the date hereof as 

 to avoid further losses incur.        

         

We enclosed hereby the GIA report of SKV 5005 H for your kind attention.  

         
Failing  which,  our client  have no alternative but  to  proceed with the necessary repairs and  

the bill will be forward to you for reimbursement.     

         
Yours faithfully,        

         

         

         

         

         
KAI  MOTOR TRADING       

         

  

--  

Have a nice day with thanks. 

祝祝祝祝您您您您有美好的一天有美好的一天有美好的一天有美好的一天。 

  

  

Ms Kim 

 

Kai Motor Trading 

 

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440  

Singapore 408701  

Telephone: 6747 4006 

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended 

recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender 

immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.  
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Kai Motor Trading 
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