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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: May 7, 2021 6:06 PM
To: Chongmeng Ng
Subject: Sgh5454R/ sha3797P

Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
The accident happened along the slip road of Jalan Bukit Merah leading towards Tiong Bahru Road. Traffic 
flow usually is quite heavy. This is a head to rear collision, where you mention that damages to third party taxi 
is minimal. The below are the considerations of the collision :  
 
You said that taxi did not  move off even through there was no vehicle on the main road causing you to collide 
into the rear of taxi. Scene photos you showed for both vehicles simply reveals that damage to taxi is not 
minimal as you alleged. The rear bumper is badly dented  and the impact force cause the boot lid is damaged as 
well. 
 
As we know , vehicles are designed to absorb impact energy caused by collision instead of resist energy. 
Therefore , taxi rear bumper has fully absorbed the impact caused by your vehicle. Again, the front portion of 
vehicle is designed to house most of mechanical and electrical components , which render the front portion solid 
and strong. Based on the damage to your vehicle which is a Mercedes model, we are convinced that it would be 
corresponding damage to taxi rear portion. 
 
Our surveyor who have inspected and checked each and every damaged item before the repair and confirmed 
the damage is consistent. Next , the damage photos taken by you at the accident scene and photos taken by our 
surveyors are completely tally. Therefore , we are in the opinion and view that damage to taxi is fair and 
reasonable which reflects the actual circumstances of accident. 
 
If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them 
in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 17/05/2021, after that we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party 
claimant on the without prejudice basis. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Chongmeng Ng <canglobal5499@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, 11 December 2020 8:41 AM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Sgh5454R/ sha3797P 
 
Please note the damage to SHA3797 P is minimal and taxi driver cannot over claim on this accident . 
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Sent from my iPhone 


