Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 March 2021 6:42 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: FBK4466G LAMBRETTA V200

From: Darren

Sent: Tuesday, 9 March 2021 6:42:16 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FBK4466G LAMBRETTA V200

Hi Taufikh,
We confirmed finalize amount.

Darren

Karz Works Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-23 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 68442475

Fax: 68442474

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 5 March 2021 5:27 PM

To: Darren

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FBK4466G LAMBRETTA V200

Hi Darren,
Refer attached, COR |/s$2000, 5 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Darren [mailto:karzworks.sg@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 18 December 2020 9:23 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: FBK4466G LAMBRETTA V200

Hi Taufikh,

FYNA

Based on estimate calculation:

COR @ $3200
DOR @ 5 Days



Kindly revise and get back to us soonest.

Darren

Karz Works Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-23 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 68442475

Fax: 68442474
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