Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Venda Claims Dept <claims@vendaengrg.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 January 2021 5:07 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Re: Your Ref: XE3776P // LKK Ref: CC4/LPC20012398/R1ps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YK
8881S(Lonpac) AND XE 3776P ON 09/10/2020]

Attachments: XE3776P_09102020_DV.pdf

Hi Jaslin,

Please find attached the signed DV for your further action.
Did the original DV need to post out to you?
Thank you.

Pe1 Jin

Venda Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
No 8 Tuas Avenue 18

Singapore 638892

(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5_Workshop)

Tel : 8126 8587

On Wed, Jan 13, 2021 at 2:33 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for acceptance.

Please duly sign the Discharge Voucher enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Venda Claims Dept <claims@vendaengrg.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 January 2021 1:41 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: XE3776P // LKK Ref: CC4/LPC20012398/R1ps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YK 8881S(Lonpac) AND XE
3776P ON 09/10/2020]

Hi Jaslin,

We agreed to your offer.

Kindly please provide your DV to us.

Thank you.

Pei Jin

Venda Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
No 8 Tuas Avenue 18

Singapore 638892

(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5_Workshop)

Tel : 8126 8587

On Wed, Jan 13, 2021 at 11:54 AM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: XE 3776P
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC20012398/R1ps3q2 Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YK 8881S AND XE 3776P ON 09/10/2020



We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement at a global sum of $6,900.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 December 2020 12:50 PM

To: claims@vendaengrg.com.sg

Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: XE3776P // LKK Ref: CC4/LPC20012398/R1ps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YK 8881S(Lonpac) AND XE
3776P ON 09/10/2020]

Without Prejudice

Hi Pei Jin,

We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 02 Dec 2020.

We will look into the matter and get back to you.

Hi Jaslin,



FYNA, Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Venda Claims Dept <claims@vendaengrg.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 December 2020 12:29 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: XE3776P // LKK Ref: CC4/LPC20012398/R1ps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YK 8881S(Lonpac) AND XE
3776P ON 09/10/2020]

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Attached LOD document and ATA for your attention please.

Kindly assist to revert us with the liability issue/offer if direct settlement is in order.



Thank you.

Pe1 Jin

Venda Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
No 8 Tuas Avenue 18

Singapore 638892

(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5_Workshop)

Tel : 8126 8587

On Mon, Nov 16, 2020 at 8:51 AM Venda Claims Dept <claims@vendaengrg.com.sg> wrote:

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Please find attached the video footage for your further action.

Thank you.

Pe1 Jin

Venda Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
No 8 Tuas Avenue 18

Singapore 638892

(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5_Workshop)

Tel : 8126 8587

Virus-free. www.avast.com

On Sat, Nov 14, 2020 at 11:47 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: XE3776P Without Prejudice

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC20012398/R1ps3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



ACCIDENT INVOLVING YK 8881S(Lonpac) AND XE 3776P ON 09/10/2020

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy
reference.

As per Lonpac instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Virus-free. www.avast.com



