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[MANDATE GIVEN] [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] MSFCIL REF: D20004567MFSH -
RE: SDH9280J & SHC1800R on 5/11/20

Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Tue 6/1/2021 10:23 AM

To:  Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Dear Jaslin,
 
We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.
 
You have our mandate to settle the matter from $8,550.29 - $8,764.29 (all in).
 
Please start to offer LOR @ $100 x 12-14 days + GST.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 |  Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on
Work From Home arrangement. However, we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We
have access to e-mails and will work to respond in a timely manner.
 
We appreciate your kind understanding. Stay safe.
 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 1 June 2021 9:58 am

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] MSFCIL REF: D20004567MFSH - RE: SDH9280J & SHC1800R on
5/11/20
 

Dear Vic

 

TP confirm that they are claiming for Medical Bills only and no further injury claim for this
accident.
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Kindly let us have your mandate approval soon.

 

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, May 21, 2021 9:59 AM

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] MSFCIL REF: D20004567MFSH - RE: SDH9280J & SHC1800R on
5/11/20
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
 
Dear Vic
 
TP not yet reply. We will send reminder again.
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 21 May 2021 9:57 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] MSFCIL REF: D20004567MFSH - RE: SDH9280J & SHC1800R on
5/11/20
 
Dear Jaslin,
 
Please advise update on the matter.
 
Kindly follow up TP if no response from them yet.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,

mailto:JaslinKok@lkkauto.com
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Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 |  Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on Work From
Home arrangement. However, we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We have access to e-mails and
will work to respond in a timely manner.
 
We appreciate your kind understanding. Stay safe.
 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Thursday, 22 April 2021 5:39 pm

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] MSFCIL REF: D20004567MFSH - RE: SDH9280J & SHC1800R on 5/11/20
 
Dear Vic
 
Please be informed that we are still pending reply from TP workshop.
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 22 April 2021 5:38 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] MSFCIL REF: D20004567MFSH - RE: SDH9280J & SHC1800R on 5/11/20
 
Dear Jaslin,

We refer further to our below email.
 
Please check and confirm with TP that they are claiming for Medical Bills only and no further injury claim for
this accident.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
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Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 |  Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan 

Sent: Monday, 5 April 2021 3:29 pm

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] MSFCIL REF: D20004567MFSH - RE: SDH9280J & SHC1800R on 5/11/20
 
Dear Jaslin,

We refer to your below email.
 
Please check and confirm with TP that they are claiming for Medical Bills only and no further injury claim for this
accident.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn.
No. 195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 5 April 2021 3:21 pm

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] MSFCIL REF: D20004567MFSH - RE: SDH9280J & SHC1800R on 5/11/20
 
Dear Vic
 
We refer to our mandate request on 17/03/2021.
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) 

Sent: Wednesday, 17 March 2021 5:37 PM

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] MSFCIL REF: D20004567MFSH - RE: SDH9280J & SHC1800R on 5/11/20
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 1800R (FCI) AND SDH 9280J (TP) ON 05/11/2020
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD" at $8,566.29
 
The summary is as follows: -
 

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 9,560.99 $ 6,901.50 ($6,450.00 +7%GST)
2. Loss of Rental (34days x $120.00) $ 4,365.60 $ 1,300.00 (13 days x $100.00)
3. Medical Fees $ 357.30 $ 357.30
4. LTA Report fee $ 7.49 $ 7.49

Total $ 14,291.38 $ 8,566.29
 
Surveyor recommended 10 days for repair + 1 Sunday + 2 PRS = 13 days
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.
 
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 17 March 2021 4:55 PM

To: 'Suann' <suann@mova.com.sg>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] MSFCIL REF: D20004567MFSH - RE: SDH9280J & SHC1800R on 5/11/20
 
Without Prejudice

Dear Suanne,
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We refer to your below email and the contents were duly noted.
 
Please be informed that this matter is handled by LKK on behalf of us and they will get back to you for an update/offer in
due course.
 
Thank you.
 
 
Dear Jaslin,
 
FYNA please.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn.
No. 195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
From: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Sent: Tuesday, 16 March 2021 4:34 pm

To: 'Suann' <suann@mova.com.sg>; Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: FW: SDH9280J & SHC1800R on 5/11/20
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Motor Claims,
 
For your necessary action to redirect to the OIC taking over.
 
Dear Sir,
 
I have forwarded your request to Motor Claims to assist.
 
Jason Tea
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580 | Email:
jasontea@msfirstcapital.com.sg |  : 6222 3547 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C
 
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection
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Statement.
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the
addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you
have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
From: Suann <suann@mova.com.sg> 

Sent: 16 March 2021 16:22

To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: SDH9280J & SHC1800R on 5/11/20
 
Dear Jason
 
Your ref : D20004567MFSH
 
Enclosed is our letter of demand for your attention & action.
 
Thank you
 
Best Regards

Suanne Chiu

Claims Asst.Manager

MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: +65 6272 3892
Fax: +65 6270 8314
 

 

Connect with us on 
 
Privileged/Confidential Information may be contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or responsible for

delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and

kindly notify the sender by reply email. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not

be deemed as unless otherwise indicated by an authorized representative independent of this message.
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