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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Leonard Wee <leonard.wee@bkw.sg>
Sent: Friday, 5 March 2021 12:42 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Su Li (LKK Auto); Yannie Ting; Accounts
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: **SPAM** RE: RE: AUTHORISATION FOR CAR RENTAL - TP - SMG 7084X 

REPAIRER : VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE CENTRE SINGAPORE VOLKSWAGEN
CENTRE SINGAPORE CENTRE SINGAPORE REPAIRER : VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE 
SINGAPORE CENTRE SINGAPORE VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE ...

Dear Cecilia 
 
 
Cust did not take the replacement car  
 
 
Regards 
Leo 
BKW RENT A CAR PTE LTD 
 
Get Outlook for iOS 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Friday, March 5, 2021 12:22:19 PM 
To: Leonard Wee <leonard.wee@bkw.sg>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>; Yannie Ting <yannie.ting@bkw.sg>; 
Accounts <accounts@bkw.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: **SPAM** RE: RE: AUTHORISATION FOR CAR RENTAL - TP - SMG 7084X REPAIRER : VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE 
SINGAPORE CENTRE SINGAPORE VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE CENTRE SINGAPORE REPAIRER : VOLKSWAGEN 
CENTRE SINGAPORE CENTRE SINGAPORE VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE CENT...  
  
Dear Leonard / Yannie, 
  
Kindly let us have the rental invoice and agreement urgently.  
  
Thanks  
  
  

  

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email:  CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  
From: Leonard Wee [mailto:leonard.wee@bkw.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 19 February 2021 1:16 PM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>; Yannie Ting 
<yannie.ting@bkw.sg>; Accounts <accounts@bkw.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
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Subject: Re: **SPAM** RE: AUTHORISATION FOR CAR RENTAL - TP - SMG 7084X REPAIRER : VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE 
SINGAPORE CENTRE SINGAPORE VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE CENTRE SINGAPORE 
  
Dear all  
  
  
Well noted 
  
  
Aside Yannie kindly assist thanks 
  
  
Regards 
Leo 
BKW RENT A CAR PTE LTD 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Friday, February 19, 2021 12:48 PM 
To: Leonard Wee; Su Li (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: **SPAM** RE: AUTHORISATION FOR CAR RENTAL - TP - SMG 7084X REPAIRER : VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE 
SINGAPORE CENTRE SINGAPORE VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE CENTRE SINGAPORE  
  
2ND REMINDER  
  
Dear Leonard, 
  
Kindly let us have a copy of rental agreement and invoice.  
  
Thanks  
  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. 
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Monday, 8 February 2021 4:17 PM 
To: Leonard Wee <leonard.wee@bkw.sg>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: **SPAM** AUTHORISATION FOR CAR RENTAL - TP - SMG 7084X REPAIRER : VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE 
SINGAPORE CENTRE SINGAPORE 
  
Dear Leonard, 
  
Kindly let us have a copy of rental agreement and invoice.  
  
Thanks  
  
  

  

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email:  CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  
From: Leonard Wee [mailto:leonard.wee@bkw.sg]  
Sent: Monday, 7 December 2020 10:49 AM 
To: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: **SPAM** AUTHORISATION FOR CAR RENTAL - TP - SMG 7084X REPAIRER : VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE 
SINGAPORE CENTRE SINGAPORE 
  
Dear Su li 
  
  
Well noted 
  
  
Regards, 
Leonard Wee 

BKW RENT A CAR PTE LTD 

HP : 8799 9668 
  

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 7 December 2020 10:48 AM 
To: Leonard Wee <leonard.wee@bkw.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: **SPAM** AUTHORISATION FOR CAR RENTAL - TP - SMG 7084X REPAIRER : VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE 
SINGAPORE CENTRE SINGAPORE 
  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Leo,=  

  


