A4

WEARNES

Our Reference: EY6000U/7019066 By Email / Mail
Your Reference: SH6078U

18/03/2021

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED C/O LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS
Attn: Third Party Claim Department -

ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY6000U & SH6078U ON 31 Oct 2020.

Dear Officer,

We wish to inform you that the repairs to our client vehicle have been completed.

We hereby submit the claims as follows:

Details Remarks Amount (SGD)
Cost of Repairs $16,714.27
Loss Of Use $120.00 x 6 days $720.00
Others

TOTAL $17,434.27

Kindly let us have your offer to Christine.yow(@wearnes.com

Your soonest reply is much appreciated. Thank you.

Yours faithfully

Christine Yow

D (65) 6430 4899

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
Bodyshop and Paint Division
249 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159935

This is a computer generated printout, no signature is required.

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.
45 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 T 65 6430 4700 www.wearnesauto.com

Co reg no. 1995071400R



(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)

Vehicle No : E/S Do Model |: Sﬁh e
] | Sfotgu

Date of Accident : %\ \\Q\lb
Global Sum Settlement | : | O YES P/No
Liability - 100 % (Agreed/Asse?éd]
Repair Estimate 1S 19,4, 28
Final Repair Cost S JEFHHA
Loss of Use H R OP) 06 daysat$ [)9 perday
Rental (if any) “'S daysat$ (incls of GST) per day
Others S
- T

1S

$

Final Settlement Sum $ [HHOH. 13
Remarks:
Payment Instruction: Payee’s Breakdown
1) | WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD 18 [(3H 2T
2| Tin YR RAT HS O F20
3) S
4) $




SERVICE TAX INVOICE
SL: FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

0 - F00O0O03
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
36 ROBINSON ROAD
#16-01, CITY HOUSE
SINGAPORE
Singapore 068877

Closed by .... : Paul Ong Qing Yong
Sve Consultant : ACC
Remarks ...... : Mr Tan Yew Kiat

Parts/Op.No Description

802 TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER,
REAR RH FENDER ETC

800 TO SPRAYPAINT ON
REAR BUMPER & FENDER RHR

280 TO CHECK WIRING INCLUDE
RESETTING OF ALL ELECTRICAL
MODULES

0031 TO REPLACE REAR RH RIM

419 WHEEL ALIGNMENT

802 TO REPLACE REAR WINDSCREEN

0080 TO INSTALL REAR WINDSCREEN FIL
C2Z14002XX BUMPER COVER REAR XF

C2Z5505 FENDER PANEL REAR RH
C2z228997 WINDSCREEN REAR S207
XR82142 WINDSCREEN SPACER
C2D49241 SEALANT WINDSCREEN
C2P18511 VWHEEL-ROAD-ALLOY

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.
45 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 T +65 6430 4700 www.wearnesauto.com

Co reg no. 199501400R / GST reg no. M28920628X

Inv.
Inv.

WIP

Veh.

*Tel

Chassis No:

No. .
date.
No.

.No.
Reg.
Reg.
Mileage

No. .
date

Mech Qty
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
1.0 EA
1.0 EA
1.0 EA
4.0 EA
2.0 EA
1.0 EA

In/Out:

RY A

WEARNES

GST Reg.No:M28920628X
7019066 Page

B&P

10/03/2021

487

00

EY6000U

20/03/2015

41,693

SAJACO5M4FPU66801

i

02/12/2020 17/02/2021

Price Disc% Pkg Amount

3150
1600

525.

90,
280.
600,
280.

241 9l
5336.
1164.

159,
1035

.00
.00
00
00
00
00
00

60
40

.20

50

.00

10
10
10
10
10
10

(@]

OO0 00O

3,150,
1,600.

<) A4%)

50
600

287

931.

00
00

.00

.00
280.
.00
280.
1,975.
4,802.
1,047.
29,
.10

00

00
59
94
96
52

50

wn

nmununnuninumnmin



YA

WEARNES

SERVICE TAX INVOICE

0 - FO00O03 SL: FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD GST Reg.No:M28920628X
36 ROBINSON ROAD Inv.No. . : B&P 7019066 Page 2
#16-01, CITY HOUSE Inv.date. : 10/03/2021
SINGAPORE WIP No. . : 48700
Singapore 068877 Veh.In/Out: 02/12/2020 17/02/2021
*Tel.No. . :
Reg.No. . : EY&000U
Closed by .... : Paul Ong Qing Yong Reg.date. : 20/03/2015
Svce Consultant : ACC Mileage . : 41,693
Remarks ...... : Mr Tan Yew Kiat Chassis No: SAJACO05M4FPU66801
Parts/Op.No Description Mech Qty Price Disc% Pkg Amount G
V031385366 *D* WELDING PRIMER 1.0 EA 68.00 10 61.20 8
Gross Total. 15,620.81
Labour Total 6,485.00 Net......... 15,620.81
Parts Total 9,135,811 GST @ 7.0% 1,093.46
Package Total 0.00 Total....... 16,714.27
Paid........ 0.00
Please Pay.. 16,714.27

GST: S=StdRated; 0O=0utOfScope; 2Z=ZeroRated
Enquiries must be lodged within 14 days from the invoice date
This is a computer generated invoice. No signature is required.

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.
45 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 T +65 6430 4700 www.wearnesauto.com

Co reg no. 199501400R / GST reg no. M28920628X



Paul Ong Qing Yong

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 4, 2021 10:14 AM

To: Paul Ong Qing Yong

Cc: jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com

Subject: RE: EY6000U for Finalise

Attachments: supp.pdf; 0598_001.pdf; EY6000 marking.pdf
Hi Paul,

COR $15,620.81, 6 days.

Subject to insurance approval

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Paul Ong Qing Yong [mailto:paul.ong@wearnes.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 17 February 2021 9:08 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: EY6000U for Finalise

Hi, for finalise

6 work days

Paul Ong
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 8126 1237 D (65) 6378 9336
WEARNES

www.wearnesauto.com paul.ong@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.aVvE.com




Paul Ong Qing Yong

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 17, 2020 10:09 AM

To: Paul Ong Qing Yong

Cc Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20004459MFSH ; YOUR REF: EY6000U *** LKK

REF : CC4/FCI20012344/T1rs3

Your Ref: EY 6000U Without Prejudice
LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20012344/T1rs3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 6078U AND EY 6000U ON 31/10/2020
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA (subject to
BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your client’s vehicle
and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to
the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our
surveyor and approved by our principal.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul.ong@wearnes.com>

Sent: Monday, 16 November 2020 9:17 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20004459MFSH ; YOUR REF: EY6000U *** LKK REF : CC4/FCI20012344/rs3

Hi Jaslin,

I note your insured report stated that his taxi was “slowly moving and accidentally grazed the right rear of the Jaguar”



Paul Ong
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 8126 1237 D (65) 6378 9336
www.wearnesauto.com  paul ong@wearnes.com

WEARNES

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 9:07 AM

To: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul.ong@wearnes.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20004459MFSH ; YOUR REF: EY6000U *** | KK REF : CC4/FCI20012344/rs3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your perusal.

Kindly advise if there is any accident video footage (not after accident video footage) from your client. If so, kindly
forward to us.
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul.ong@wearnes.com>

Sent: Friday, 13 November 2020 10:42 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20004459MFSH ; YOUR REF: EY6000U

Can check liability, thanks .

Paul Ong
Service Congullant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 8126 1237 D (65) 6378 9336
WEARNES

www. wearnesauto.com paul.ong@wearnes.com




This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Claim Workflow System <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, November 11, 2020 9:17 AM

To: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul.onpg@wearnes.com>

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS @ MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; RACHELWU@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20004459MFSH ; YOUR REF: EY6000U

Dear Sir/Madam

PRI Request For EY6000U Accident Involving SH6078U On 31-10-2020 AT 19:15:00HRS.
Please find below details for your reference

e Claim number : D20004459MFSH

¢ Insured vehicle number : SH6078U

o Accident date : 31-10-2020

¢ Third-party vehicle number : EY6000U

e Assignment type : WITHOUT PREJUDICE

e Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
e Officer-in-Charge : RACHELWU LIMEI

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849



MSME20096384 / SME Molor Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit

ENTRY DATE & TIME: 02/11/2020 15:52
SUBMITTED BY: Chia Pei Ying

IMPORTANT NOTICE

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver,

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurale as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies 1o

repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by Lhe insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for

archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available

aforesaid.

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

02/11/2020 15:52
31/10/2020 19:00

OUTSIDE 102 SIANG KUANG AVE

SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number

Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company

Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Policy Number
Cover Note Number
Driver

Name of Driver
NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number
Contact Number
EMail Address

EY6000U

TAN YEW KIAT
SXXXX853J
ME@MARCUSTAN.COM
(LOCAL) +65-98162228
OFFICE-98162228

JAGUAR
XF

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

ETIQA INSURANCE PTE LTD

COMPREHENSIVE
NO
MA003721

TAN YEW KIAT
SXXXX853J

02/11/1953

INDOOR

28/09/1971

49 YEARS AND 1 MONTH
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-98162228

OFFICE-98162228
ME@MARCUSTAN.COM

Page 1 of 15



Address

Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes,Please state which Police Station
Was notice of intended Prosecution given?
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

102 SIANG KUANG AVE
347998

NO

OWNER

HIT AND RUN / VANDALISM / DAMAGED WHILST PARKED
RAINING
WET

NO
2
NO
NO
YES
NO

NO

NO

MY VEHICLE IS PARKED STATIONARY OUTSIDE MY HOUSE WHEN { HEARD A LOUD BANG, | WENT OUT AND FOUND
THAT VEHICLE B HAD COLLIDED ONTO MY VEHICLE'S REAR RIGHT PORTION.

Attachment(s)
Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

Was there any audio recorded?

YES
NO
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

SHB078U

VEHICLE B
TAXI

Page 2 of 15



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Please report correctly the details of the accidenl to speed up the claims process.

. This Form must be completed by the Policyhalder and/or the Authorised Driver.

Information provided must be as truthful and aceurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withhelding of material

. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy llability on the part of the insurance

companies.

. JAny false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General insurance

Association of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested parties.

. By the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of

the report being made available aforesaid.

. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)

| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

{a) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore (“GIA”) may/are permitted to callect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out in this [form) and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident (all insurer(s) who have insured
vehicle(s) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority {such as the police), for the purpaose(s)
of :

(i) processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

(i) investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(iii) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

(iv) administering my claims (including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

{v) complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.(collectively the
“Purposes”)

{b} all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle{s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

(c) my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agents(including thelr lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes.

(d) my Personal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and all future claims.

{e) the Information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

{i} to all insurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

{i) for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

‘.--ﬂ/d_ !
Policyholder's Signaturé Driver's Signature B Reporting Centre Personnel's Signature
Date & Time: (Il driver is not the policyholder) Name:

Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 3 of 15



Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

WAy vedad, Qe Qfatione, owtide vy bowee  wob, )
l\,(’_i(ak a \uuil Viine l ]\.-m,-pr ot ,:wal Ay “Ttaef
Vde € vt M\\ﬁr:d (it e Vededde s vasr gk
poran !

\
DECLARATION

I/We declare the foregolng particulars are true in every respect.

/WM

Policyholder'_s Signature Driver's Signature Reporting Centre Personnel's Sighature
Date & Time: (If driver is not the policyholder) Name:
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 4 of 15



Sketch Plan #3 Pg. 1

LETTER OF UNDERTAKING

IWe, 70 y&n) &l , the owner of vehicle no. 52 éooTey

My/Our Insurance is under M/s Etiqa Insurance Pte Ltd , I/we shall decide whether to
claim under my/our Policy or against the Third Party and if the former shall submit
such a claim to M/s Etiqa Insurance Pte Ltd with all relevant facts and documents
within 14(fourteen) days of occurrence or discovery of damage.

My/Qur Third Party claim is handle by my/our preferred workshop, S

Signed and Acknowledge by:

Nre no. & signatmre of nalicvhalder

Page 5 of 15



Sketch Plan #3 Pg. 1

IWe, 77V yPu L7 o , the owner of vehicle no. qzj/ W

My/QOur Insurance is under M/s Etiqa Insurance Pte Ltd , I/we shall decide whether to
claim under my/our Policy or against the Third Party and if the former shall submit
such a claim to M/s Etiqa Insurance Pte Ltd with all relevant facts and documents
within 14(fourteen) days of occurrence or discovery of damage. '

My/Our Third Party claim is handle by my/our preferred workshop, — %

Signed and Acknowledge by:

Page 5 of 15



ClPg. 1

MX1
21300123

eTiQa o

. Insurance
CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE
*  MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) ACT (CHAPTER 189) ® MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION)
RUIES, 1960 ® ROAD TRANSPORT ACT, 1987 (MALAYSIA) ® MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS) RULES, 1953 (MALAYSIA}

( )

CERTIFICATE No. MAQ03721
1. Index Mark and Registration EY6000U
Number of Vehicle
2. Name of Policyholder Tan Yew Kiat
3 Effective Date of Commencement of 20/03/2020 Excess: Named Drivers 5$600

Insurance for the purposes of the Act Excess: unnamed Drivers 531,100

4. Date of Expiry of Insurance 18/03/2021 .
5. Persons or Ciasses of Persons entitled to drive

(A) THE POLICYHOLDER.

THE POLICYHOLDER MAY ALSO DRIVE A MOTOR CAR NOT BELONGING TO HIM
OR HIRED (UNDER A HIRE PURCHASE AGREEMENT OR OTHERWISE) TO HIM OR
HIS EMPLOYER OR HIS PARTNER.

(B) ANY OTHER PERSON WHO IS DRIVING ON THE POLICYHOLDER'S ORDER OR
WITH HIS PERMISSION,

Tan Yew Kiat Poon Ngerng Hiang
Tan Haa Xiong 1an Hao Yang

Provided that thé person driving is permitted in accordance with the licensing or other laws or regulations to drive the
Motor Vehlcle ar has been permitted and is not disquallfied by order of a Court of Law or by reason of any enactment or
regulations In that behalf from driving the Motor Vehicle.

6. Limitations as to Use

USE ONLY FOR SOCIAL, DOMESTIC AND PLEASURE PURPOSES AND IN CONNECTION
WITH THE POLICYHOLDER'S BUSINESS OR PROFESSION.

THE POLICY DOES NOT COVER:

( 1) USE FOR HIRE OR REWARD,

( i) USE FOR RACING, PACE-MAKING, RELIABILITY TRIAL QR SPEED-TESTING.
(ii1) USE FOR THE CARRIAGE OF GOODS (OTHER THAN SAMPLES) IN CONNECTION
WITH ANY TRADE OR BUSINESS.

( iv) USE FOR ANY PURPOSE IN CONNECTION WITH THE MOTOR TRADE.

* Limitations rendered Inoperative by Section 8 of the Motor Vehicles (Third-Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189) and Section 95 of the
Road Transport Act, 1987 {Malaysia}, are not to be included under these bindings.

L

Policy Owner's Protection Schema

This policy Is protectesd under the Policy Owner's Protection Scheme which 1s administered by the Singapare Deposit Insurante Corparation (SDIC). Covetage for yaur palicy
i aulematlc and no further attlon is required from you, For more Infarmatlon on Lhe types of benefits that are covered under the scheme ji well as the limits of coverage,
where applicable, please contact your insurer or visit the GIA / LIA or SDIC websites (www.gia.org.sg or www.lia.org.sg or www.sdlc.org.sg).

|/WE HEREBY CERTIFY that the policy to which this Certificate relates Is Issued In accordance with the provisions of the Motor Vehicles (Third-Party Risks and Compensation)

Act {Chapter 189) and Part IV of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia).
For and on behalf of Etlqa Insurance Pte. Ltd.

Approved tnsurer
GOP93167 06/02/2020 13:28:11

(O CORRERNE RO %
Authorised Signature
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Accident Photo
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Accident Photo
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Accident Photo
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Accident Photo
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Accident Photo
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AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

L TN ew T

of IO SIANG Kot ANE (address),
owner of ‘?\IC:OQDL) - (vehicle no.) hereby authorize
_ LEPeese Brymwcnve PIE jap

(“the third party claimant”)

(“the workshop”) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and / or renta)
and / or Toss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no. /600 that was
damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on %_’_, 19/ 2O (date) along

OUBIE. 10) SIANG Kuane Ay

(location)
involving vehicleno 3&_@\) -

(“the accident”).

I further authorize the workshop to sign the discharge voucher on my behalf to settle
my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further

authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with payment
cheque/s being made in Zviur of the workshop. b
I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on
a without prejudize and without admission of hability basis insofar as the driver /
owner / insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned. &

Dated this day of _ (month) 20 (vear)

Tl

Siguned by “the third party claimant”
Policyholder’s Signature only
& Company Chop — (if registered under 2 company)




