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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 1 April 2021 9:03 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: [MANDATE GIVEN] RE: MSFC TP : EY6000U / SH6078U  MSFCIL: 

D20004459MFSH/CTPL/ES

Dear Jaslin, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

You have our mandate to settle the matter from $17,314.27 - $17,434.27 (all in). 

 

Please start to offer LOR @ $100 x 6 days first. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Kind Regards, 

 

Vic Sanghilan 

Motor Claim Department 

 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. 

No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 

 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 

intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 25 March 2021 5:43 pm 

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: MSFC TP : EY6000U / SH6078U MSFCIL: D20004459MFSH/CTPL/ES 

 

Dear Sirs/Madam, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 6078U AND EY 6000U ON 31/10/2020 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer “WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD” at $ 17,434.27 (all-in). 
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The summary is as follows:- 
  

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 18,477.80 $ 16,714.27 ($15,620.81 + 7% GST) 

2. Loss of Use (6days x $120) $      720.00 $      720.00 (6days x $120) 

                                                                             Total $ 19,197.80 $ 17,434.27 

  
Surveyor recommended 6 days for repair. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. 
 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 18 March 2021 3:06 PM 

To: Christine Yow <christine.yow@wearnes.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan 

<VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: MSFC TP : EY6000U / SH6078U MSFCIL: D20004459MFSH/CTPL/ES 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Christine, 

 

LKK will revert to you on the offer. 

 

Dear LKK, 

 

Below email fyna. 

Please note that officer in-charge is Vic. 

 

Thank you 

 

Best Regards 

 

Rachel Wu 

Motor Claim Dept 

 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862 

|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C  

A Member of  Insurance Group 
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Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 

intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From: Christine Yow <christine.yow@wearnes.com>  

Sent: Thursday, March 18, 2021 2:58 PM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Subject: MSFC TP : EY6000U / SH6078U 

 

 

 
Dear OIC, 

 

We hereby attach our LOD with supporting documents for your perusal. 

 

Kindly revert  with an offer soonest. Thank you. 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 
Christine Yow 
Administrator 
Body & Paint 
 

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd 
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935 
D (65) 6430 4899 
www.wearnesauto.com      christine.yow@wearnes.com 
 

 
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.  
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.  
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you. 

 

 

 


	76c80afc83334ee09f6705c58c92f79c6e1c1ca7f1e9b4a28ad21262d829299b.pdf
	a547bbca144608545850fd2d230779c9fe12a136345010584163bb1e69d5bb79.pdf
	03488dd18001a2cb95cc68754892c588bf8cbb3aff86bbbd473077830fc0c648.pdf
	03488dd18001a2cb95cc68754892c588bf8cbb3aff86bbbd473077830fc0c648.pdf


	76c80afc83334ee09f6705c58c92f79c6e1c1ca7f1e9b4a28ad21262d829299b.pdf
	a547bbca144608545850fd2d230779c9fe12a136345010584163bb1e69d5bb79.pdf
	03488dd18001a2cb95cc68754892c588bf8cbb3aff86bbbd473077830fc0c648.pdf

	a547bbca144608545850fd2d230779c9fe12a136345010584163bb1e69d5bb79.pdf
	71a589fd5851a092432a86dfbe151e7264b03b44e90d237c37acb53125d9dacf.pdf

	a547bbca144608545850fd2d230779c9fe12a136345010584163bb1e69d5bb79.pdf
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style


	76c80afc83334ee09f6705c58c92f79c6e1c1ca7f1e9b4a28ad21262d829299b.pdf
	a547bbca144608545850fd2d230779c9fe12a136345010584163bb1e69d5bb79.pdf
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style



