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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Joseph Gay <mail@joegayco.com>
Sent: Monday, 12 July 2021 1:45 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Ler, Bernard-JQ
Cc: Admin A
Subject: SHC 5528B & SLE 7509K / DOA : 18-02-2018 - Our Ref : 172/2021/ms - Your Ref : 

CC3/AIG18003364/Kea3q2-1 - AIG Ref : 6812051433SG003

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sirs 
 
We refer to AIG's acknowledgement dated 29-06-2021 and the offer which was sent via email to our clients on 09-
07-2021 at 3:28 pm (copy attached). 
 
For a quick amicable settlement, we are prepared to advise our clients to settle their claim as follows :- 
 
1. Cost of repairs ... $8,613-50 
2. Loss of hire ... $608-76 
3. Loss of earnings ... $420-00  
4. LTA serches fees ... $14-98 
5. Costs inclusive of 7% GST and disbursements ... $642-00 
Total ... $10,299-24 
 
If you are agreeable to the above, kindly let us have your discharge voucher and payment of $10,299-24 in 
our favour as soon as possible. 
 
Kindly look forward to hearing from you soon. 
 
Regards 
 
Mavis Seo 
for Joseph Gay & Co 
Advocates & Solicitors 

UEN 53131273M  GST Reg No: M90367664A (Please note our new email address as above) 

T +65 65355878 │ F +65 65338286 │151 Chin Swee Road, #02-16 Manhattan House Singapore 169876 

Office Hours: Mondays – Fridays from 9am to 6pm.  We are closed for lunch between 1pm to 2pm and on weekends and 
Public Holidays. 

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended for the addressee(s) only and may contain confidential 
information and/or may be subject to legal privilege.  If you have received this in error, please notify us immediately by 
return email, delete this message and you should not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein. 
 
  

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Friday, 9 July, 2021 3:28 PM 
To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SHC 5528B,Our Ref: CC3/AIG18003364/Kea3q2-1 , -- AAD1802-194 
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‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
  
Dear Sirs, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Our principal propose settlement as follows: - 
                                                                                     

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $   8,613.50 
2. Loss of Rental (6days x $101.46) $      608.76 
3. Loss of Income (6days x $50) $      300.00 
4. LTA Search Fee $           7.49 

Total:      $   9,529.75 
  
   
Kindly let us have your acceptance. 
  
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 


