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Re: AUDIT CHECK SLM 9650D

Simon Ho (LKKAuto) <SimonHo@lkkauto.com>
Fri 20/11/2020 2:56 PM
To:  Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Hi Denise,

Audit check done for SLM9650D without problem.

Best Regards,

Simon Ho

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561| email: simonho@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

1Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Friday, 20 November 2020 2:41 PM 
To: Simon Ho (LKKAuto) <SimonHo@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: AUDIT CHECK SLM 9650D
 
Hi Simon,

meaning this vehicle previously is total loss then insurance sent for bidding then workshop  put up
pricing and which insurance will approve to let them reapir. this case insurance just ask us to take
over take photo. but because is rasul handle need ur audit check, if not audit cannot pass to close

Thanks and regards,
Denise
Case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: ' 62563561 Fax: 6 6256 4315
Email: + sur@lkkauto.com

From: Simon Ho (LKKAuto) <SimonHo@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Friday, 20 November 2020 2:38 PM 
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: AUDIT CHECK SLM 9650D
 
what is tender repair?

Best Regards,

Simon Ho

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561| email: simonho@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Friday, 20 November 2020 12:12 PM
To: Simon Ho (LKKAuto) <SimonHo@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: AUDIT CHECK SLM 9650D
 
Hi Simon,

This is a tender repair cost $8600, 8days, need your audit check. \

photo in merimen

Thanks and regards,
Denise
Case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: ' 62563561 Fax: 6 6256 4315
Email: + sur@lkkauto.com

mailto:sur@lkkauto.com

