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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 November 2020 3:56 PM

To: service@riverviewauto.com.sg

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SCQ321Z

Importance: High

 

 

Dear Sir, 

 

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SCQ 321Z (Excess $750/-).  

 

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 

to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  

 

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before 

completion of the repair. 

 

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 

 

Noted: Resurvey for Check Item/Supplemantary and before paint are required. 

Repair on part by part, supplier parts invoice with pricing are also required. 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 10 November 2020 12:44 PM 

To: service@riverviewauto.com.sg 

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SCQ321Z 

 

Hi, 

 

Please refer to attached documents on revised labour and parts. Kindly revert to us so that we can reply to 

Insurance. Thank you. 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

 

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) [mailto:celinefong@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 10 November 2020 11:31 AM 
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To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
Subject: FW: attn:celine 

 

Hi Taufikh, 

 

Please assist. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Service <service@riverviewauto.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 9 November 2020 2:05 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: attn:celine 

 

  

Thanks and Regards 
  
Riverview Auto Services Pte Ltd 
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A 
AMK Autopoint # 04-07 / # 04-16 
Singapore 568047 
  
Tel : +65 6481 2025 
Fax :+65 6481 8715 
E-mail: service@riverviewauto.com.sg 
Web : http//www.riverviewauto.com.sg 
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