Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 November 2020 10:12 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: ‘Accounts ( Ding Auto )'; Admin A; Su Li (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Third Party Claims - SLD6163K against SMF5164S - Arrange Survey and Check

Liabiity LKK REF : CC4/AIG20012248/gs3

Dear Cecilia,

Good day to you.

We would like to drop claims from my side as driver will proceed with other workshop or etc.
Please cancel the vehicle survey.

Thank you so much.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding
HP: 92313123

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, November 9, 2020 4:01 PM

To: 'Kenneth Ding'

Cc: 'Accounts ( Ding Auto )'; Admin A; Su Li (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Third Party Claims - SLD6163K against SMF5164S - Arrange Survey and Check Liabiity LKK REF :
CC4/A1G20012248/gs3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Kenneth,

We refer to the above matter

The liability is unclear.

Kindly let us have a copy of video footage to review the matter.

Attached is a copy of OI’s report.

Thanks

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed
/ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



