India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street

#04-00/#05-00 10B Building
Singapore 049711

Attn: Motor Claims Dept
Dear Sir/ Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBE 8677U AND PC 8778G ALONG
MACPHERSON RD TWDS PIE ON 05/11/2020

We understand that you are the insurer of PC 8778G vehicle.

We are instructed by the owner of motor vehicle GBE 8677U to write, negotiate and settle

the claim on their behalf for the abovementioned accident. We therefore propose to claim
from you as follows: -

1. Cost of repair S$ 2,500.00
2. Loss of Use (4days x $100.00) S$  400.00
3. LTA Search fee S$ 7.45
4, Towing Fee S§ -
TOTAL S$ 2.907.45

Please let us have your reply soonest possible.

Thank you.

Yours faithfully
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Signed by “the workshop”
( with chop)
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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

|li-Direct Settiement (PODS)

india Ref: MCV2020D0002308
Claimant Ref :GBE 8677U

with the appointed Surveyor of India international Insurance Pte Ltd

2,900.00 _(Groireis

of Surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S§

_ ("the workshop

"y hereby confirm that well have reached an agreement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (name

e wiwommobmiow), vehicle no. GBE 8677U that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred

(location) involving vehicle no. PC 8778G (insured

at “the workshop’

Well confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner HAM CREAT|ONS PTELTD ("the third party

claimant”) of vehicle naGBE 8677Uto make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settie
the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that well deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by "the third

party claimant".

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify India international Insurance Pte Ltd for ail damages. loss and/or expense that

they will or have already incurred in the event that "the third party claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a

further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered

pertaining to cost of repairs and/or rental and/or loss

of use pursuant to the damage to GBE 8877 (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

\We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full an

d final settlement of all claims of "the third party claimant"

pursuant to the accident and that further this seltlement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability

basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over any

dispute arising out ofthe same.

Well authorlzeyoutopaythetotalamountof8$21900-00 to SIN Ho AUTO

05 . FEBRUARY . 2t

Dated this v day of s
e
2, 4":, ’
CLAIMANT: ] 0
*

Signature:

Name: g 3 Om’;e ’7;_6_0 R
NRIC: Séf—??%z. ......................

Address.

Nationality:

Occupation:

WITNESS:
Lup
Signature:
Signed by appointed Surveyor
Name: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
NRIC: 199607198R
Address: 51 Ubi Avenue 1

Mationality

Cccupation




SIN HO AUTO

Blk 30204 #01-33 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408714

INVOICE

INDIA INTERNATION AL IN SURANCE PTE LTD Date: 19-Dec-20
64 CECIL STREET #04/#05/#06-02

0B BUILDIN G

Singapore 049711

Accident date: 05 NOW 2020
Fimal Bill For Vehicle No: GBEBGTTU NISSAN CABSTAR 3.0

Descriptions AMOUNT

| ump Sum repair cost as recommended by $2,500.00
| KK AUTO CON SULTANTS PTE LTD

SIDLR5: TWO THOU SAND FIVE HUNDRED ONLY




Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-201106-000859
Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference
No.
Result of Insurance Enquiry - PC8778G
As at 05 Nov 2020/03:15:00
Insurance Co: INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - PC8778G
Enquiry Fee
20201106100557932333

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Print Date/Time :

Receipt Date/Time :

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Sub-Total

Total Before Rounding
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable
Paid By
20201106100626227
Total

Cash Change
Tendered Amount

Excess Refundable Amount

Amount GST
Before Amount
GST (S%) (S9%)
7.00 0.49

7.00 0.49

7.00 0.49

Direct Debit: eNETS Debit
(Internet Banking)

06 Nov 2020/ 10:07:41
06 Nov 2020/ 10:07:40

Amount
After GST
(S9)

7.49

7.49
7.49
0.04
7.45

7.45
7.45
0.00
7.45
0.00

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 5 February 2021 11:17 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: GBE8677U Doa 5/11/20 LKK REF : CC6/11120012181/bs3

Dear Jasper,

UOB A/C NO: 3783032412
Please bank in the payment to this account & update me once done . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 3, 2021 10:18 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GBE8677U Doa 5/11/20 LKK REF : CC6/11120012181/bs3
Dear Jasper,

Enclosed is the DV .
This payment by giro or issue chq ? Please check need fill in giro form or got our workshop record ?

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 2, 2021 3:38 PM

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: GBES8677U Doa 5/11/20 LKK REF : CC6/11120012181/bs3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return document to us (LKK) for our necessary action.
Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 2 February 2021 3:19 PM



2/5/2021 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*GBE8677U (MCV2020D0002308)
[PC8778G]
TP
H.A.M CREATIONS PTE LTD
Nov 5 2020 3:00AM
[-]
Sin Ho Auto

| Reply || Reply All || Mark as Unread || Print Message || Delete Message || Forward |

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (III_SG), sent on 21/01/2021 18:28 PM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$3082.45) - GBE8677U - Claim Handler: Derrick Tan Ming Chye

Approved:3082.45:Dear Sir, please proceed with direct settlement. Thank you

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1792959&iDomainld=11&iObjld=10684...  1/2



https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCobj&fuseaction=dsp_objlink&domainid=1&objid=968490&extid=348332&CFID=81729202&CFTOKEN=1117419757f164aa-5D41CFBF-92F2-6F7A-9DD658CAE112D0CD&USID=10684&RID=9010373
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=81729202&CFTOKEN=1117419757f164aa-5D41CFBF-92F2-6F7A-9DD658CAE112D0CD&USID=10684&RID=9010373
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=81729202&CFTOKEN=1117419757f164aa-5D41CFBF-92F2-6F7A-9DD658CAE112D0CD&USID=10684&RID=9010373
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=81729202&CFTOKEN=1117419757f164aa-5D41CFBF-92F2-6F7A-9DD658CAE112D0CD&USID=10684&RID=9010373
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=81729202&CFTOKEN=1117419757f164aa-5D41CFBF-92F2-6F7A-9DD658CAE112D0CD&USID=10684&RID=9010373&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DSVCmail%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_view%26mode%3D1%26iinboxid%3D1792959%26iDomainId%3D11%26iObjId%3D10684%26iRecipientAliasId%3D12%26cur_ialiasid%3D12%26cur_vaalias%3DLKK_HQ%26assocdomain%3D1%26assocobj%3D968490%26assocobj2%3D348332%26urlback%3D%252Fclaims%252Findex%252Ecfm%253Ffusebox%253DMTRadjuster%2526fuseaction%253Ddsp%255Fclmheader%2526caseid%253D968490%2526extid%253D348332%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=81729202&CFTOKEN=1117419757f164aa-5D41CFBF-92F2-6F7A-9DD658CAE112D0CD&USID=10684&RID=9010373
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