
1

Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Darren <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 November 2020 4:39 PM

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto)

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2011-05 // YOURREF : GY5195Z ACCIDENT INVOLVING GY5195Z 

AND SMC1993H

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Nivitha, 

 

Please kindly take note that the property damage claim for vehicle SMC1993H will not proceed at our end anymore. 

 

The owner still deserved the rights to proceed third party claim at another workshop. 

 

Darren 

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 

53 Ubi Avenue 1 

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore 408934 

Tel: 68442475 

Fax: 68442474 

 

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) 

Sent: Friday, 6 November 2020 10:25 AM 

To: 'TEAMWORK' 

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com 

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2011-05 // YOURREF : GY5195Z ACCIDENT INVOLVING GY5195Z AND SMC1993H 

 

Dear Darren, 

 

Noted with thanks. 

 

As for the liability you may refer to China Taiping. 

 

Thank you and have a nice day too.! 

 
 

 

BEST REGARDS 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

 

From: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  

Sent: Friday, 6 November 2020 10:10 AM 
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To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2011-05 // YOURREF : GY5195Z ACCIDENT INVOLVING GY5195Z AND SMC1993H 

 

Dear Nivitha, 

 

Yes kindly arrange Steve. 

 

May I check with you who is the officer-in-charge for this case? 

 

Thank you and have a nice day. 

 

Regards, 

 

Shu Shan 

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 

Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 

#01-24 

Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore 408934 

Tel: 6844 2475  

Fax:6844 2474 

 

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) 

Sent: Friday, 6 November 2020 10:07 AM 

To: 'TEAMWORK' 

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2011-05 // YOURREF : GY5195Z ACCIDENT INVOLVING GY5195Z AND SMC1993H 

 

Dear Darren, 

 

He is covering west today. May I arrange steve? 

 
 

 

BEST REGARDS 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

 

From: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  

Sent: Friday, 6 November 2020 10:03 AM 

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2011-05 // YOURREF : GY5195Z ACCIDENT INVOLVING GY5195Z AND SMC1993H 

 

Dear Nivitha, 

 

Can arrange Taufikh to take pictures first? 
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Thank you and have a nice day. 

 

Regards, 

 

Shu Shan 

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 

Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 

#01-24 

Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore 408934 

Tel: 6844 2475  

Fax:6844 2474 

 

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) 

Sent: Friday, 6 November 2020 9:49 AM 

To: 'TEAMWORK' 

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2011-05 // YOURREF : GY5195Z ACCIDENT INVOLVING GY5195Z AND SMC1993H 

 

Got estimate? 

 
 

 

BEST REGARDS 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

 

From: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  

Sent: Friday, 6 November 2020 9:38 AM 

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com; TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2011-05 // YOURREF : GY5195Z ACCIDENT INVOLVING GY5195Z AND SMC1993H 

 

Dear Nivitha, 

 

Yes vehicle SMC 1993H is in the workshop. 

 

Thank you and have a nice day. 

 

Regards, 

 

Shu Shan 

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 

Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 

#01-24 

Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore 408934 

Tel: 6844 2475  
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Fax:6844 2474 

 

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) 

Sent: Friday, 6 November 2020 9:36 AM 

To: claims@teamworkgarage.com 

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com 

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2011-05 // YOURREF : GY5195Z ACCIDENT INVOLVING GY5195Z AND SMC1993H 

 

Dear Darren, 

 

Is the vehicle SMC 1993H in the workshop? 

 

 
 

 

BEST REGARDS 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

 

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 6 November 2020 8:49 AM 

To: claims@teamworkgarage.com 

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com 

Subject: OUR REF : 2011-05 // YOURREF : GY5195Z ACCIDENT INVOLVING GY5195Z AND SMC1993H 

 

Dear Darren, 

 

Is the vehicle SMC 1993H in the workshop? 

 
 

 

BEST REGARDS 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 
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