Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 November 2020 2:18 PM

To: Enquiry

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : SLB6301P claiming TP vehicle no : SGJ7277L
D.O.A. 21/10/2020

Attachments: scene photo.JPG; Statement.JPG

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/ Madam,

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on both party’s statement ,
our insured was entering the car park where your client was exiting. As our insured

mentioned your client’s vehicle occupied the space of our insured ‘s driving route, which this indicate that
your client did not stop at the exit point to give way to our insured from entering the car park.

From scene photo provided by our insured(as attached), your client vehicle encroached into our insured 's
travelling path. Hence, liability is down on your client. Kindly refer to our insured’s statement as attached
for your reference.

As such, we have our principal’s instruction and that we are unable to look into your client’s claim.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 November 2020 3:48 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : SLB6301P claiming TP vehicle no : SGJ7277L D.0.A. 21/10/2020
Dear Jasper,

No video footage.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong



S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02

Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) [mailto:jasperchua@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 19 November 2020 2:26 PM

To: Enquiry

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : SLB6301P claiming TP vehicle no : SGJ7277L D.O.A. 21/10/2020

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly advise whether there’s any video footage.
Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd
Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 November 2020 12:09 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : SLB6301P claiming TP vehicle no : SGJ7277L D.0O.A. 21/10/2020

Dear Jasper,
Any status?
Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02

Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Enquiry [mailto:enquiry@sh-motor.com]

Sent: Monday, 16 November 2020 10:56 AM

To: 'Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)'

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : SLB6301P claiming TP vehicle no : SGJ7277L D.O.A. 21/10/2020

Dear Jasper,
Our Insured called and chased for reply, any update?

Thanks & Best Regards,



