Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Tew Ai Nee <ainee@motorway.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 10 November 2020 9:38 am
To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZE GBB333E DOA: 16.10.2020
Dear Rasul,

Confirm the COR.

Thanks & Regards
Ainee

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@I|kkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 10 November, 2020 9:28 AM

To: Tew Ai Nee <ainee@motorway.com.sg>
Subject: RE: FINALIZE GBB333E DOA: 16.10.2020

Hi Ai Nee,

Finalised amount is $ 900 / 3 days of repair
Kindly confirm

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
B 74 74
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From: Tew Ai Nee [mailto:ainee@motorway.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 10 November, 2020 8:55 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: FINALIZE GBB333E DOA: 16.10.2020

Dear Rasul,

Can we finalize.
Attach after paint photos for your reference.

What is the liability status.

Best Regards,

Annie Tew

Motor Claims Department

Motorway Car Care Centre Pte Ltd

1094 Lower Delta Road, Motorway Building, Singapore 169205
DID: 6571 9642 Fax: 6278 5535



