LOT

Reference No

Priority : NORMAL / URGENT

Claim No. i OPS : Yes 1 No DOA:
Erom (Person) s 1o 7 ' af Ref:
DatefTime MV © §

TYPE: M.Car ¢ M. Cycle - Bus / Van ¢ Lorry / Taxi/ Prime Mover / Truck / Trailer of

vehicle No : (AR 6 D.O.A/As At
Wake & Modet: NEW CAR PRICE:$
Registration Date; MV:% Quote by : L0 ,
COE Expiry Date: FS:$ Date
LTA Total Rebate Amount: (PARF) + (COE) _ = SVvi$
Calculation for LTA Rebate: Calculation for Valuation:
(1) COE Period: X12= Mths Average MV $
As At
2 = Mths Calculation for Repossessed vehicle:
- = Mths High demand vehicle:  Yes / No - 3
{b) Balance Months : Parallel Import vehicle: Yes / No - % .
More than 10yrs oid: Yes / No - 3
[ ssed icl =
(4) Residue COE : QP i I MV for Repossessed vehicls $
(a) -] |
i Engine Capacity: High/low | - &
(a) - (b) = M2=__<__yrs Europe / Asia Car - $
Register Before/After MAY 2002 Car Condition: Good/Fair/Poor/Burnt | - $
(e) PARF = (OMV) X X & No. of transfer : ) - 3
L.TA Total Rebate Amount: (d)+(e) -10ther deduction -3
Salvage Value(LTA Rebate - 5%): Forced Sales Value derived = $

Date/ Time Acftion / Instruction

Additional Information:
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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Darren Lee <Darren.Lee@hlbank.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 October 2020 12:58 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Subject: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION OCT 2020
Attachments: 09102020 GBG8044K zip; PARF_COE Rebate Enquiry.pdf
Dear Celine

We would like to have a desktop Valuation for the above vehicle.
Attached with log card.

Thank you

Best Regards

Darren Lee
Collections

¥ HL Bank

1 Wallich Street, #29-01 Guoco Tower, Singapore 078881
HL: +65 6818 0503 || DID

Website: www.hlbank.com.sg

UMAN CAPITAL

ARTNER
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Visit our website: http://www.hlbank.com.sg

This e-mail and any attachments may contain confidential and privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail, delete this e-mail and destroy any copies. Any dissemination or use of this information by a person other than the intended
recipient is unauthorized and may be illegal.

**************************************************************************************
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended Deregistration Date:

Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:

Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:

First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Oct 2020

Company
422K

GBG8044K

No

310ct 2020
TOYOTA

DYNA 150 5MT
Silver

2017
1KD2753124
JTFAT35Y00K209214
$27,084.00
300ct 2017
300ct 2017

1

$1,355.00

No

$0.00

29 Oct 2027
C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$35,068.00

$24,528.00

$24,528.00



Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 23 October 2020 12:46 PM

To: Darren Lee

Subject: RE: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION OCT 2020

Dear Darren,

The valuation of GBG 8044K is as below:
MV: $49K FS: S40K

As at October 2020

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Darren Lee <Darren.Lee@hlbank.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 October 2020 12:58 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION OCT 2020

Dear Celine

We would like to have a desktop Valuation for the above vehicle.

Attached with log card.

Thank you

Best Regards

Darren Lee
Collections

¥ HL Bank

1 Wallich Street, #29-01 Guoco Tower, Singapore 078881
HL: +65 6818 0503 || DID

Website: www.hlbank.com.sg

UMAN CAPITAL
ARTNER
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Visit our website: http://www.hlbank.com.sg

This e-mail and any attachments may contain confidential and privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail, delete this e-mail and destroy any copies. Any dissemination or use of this information by a person other than the intended
recipient is unauthorized and may be illegal.
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