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Summer Lee  (LKK Auto)

From: Chin, Lee-Ying <Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November, 2020 1:28 PM

To: 'assignments'; Summer Lee  (LKK Auto)

Cc: Lim, Kok-Chong

Subject: aigencrypt GBJ7174J(AIG) & GBJ6757J on 30/10/2020

Attachments: CI.pdf; GIA.pdf; Repair Quotation.pdf

Hi LKK, 

 

Kindly assist to survey. 

 

 

Thanks. 

 

Best Regards 

Lee Ying, Chin 

AIG 

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 

Tel +(65) 6419 1947 

Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com | www.aig.sg  

 

 

 

From: MTC <mtc@mega-auto.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, November 03, 2020 12:48 PM 

To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey <AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: RE: GBJ7174J(AIG) & GBJ6757J on 30/10/2020 

 

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Hi, 

 

Our Location :  

Mega Auto Pte Ltd 

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-01 AutoCity Singapore 575722 

 

Person in charge : Mr. Meng 9758 2943. 

 

 

Thank you 

 

Sarah Chan 

Mega Auto Pte Ltd 

Tel : 8468 9838 Fax : 6458 5884 

 

 

 

 

 

From: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey [mailto:AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com]  

Sent: 03 November 2020 12:29 
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To: MTC 
Subject: RE: RE: GBJ7174J(AIG) & GBJ6757J on 30/10/2020 

 

Hi Sarah, 

 

Where is the survey venue? 

 

 

Thanks. 

 

AIG Claims Survey 

 

 

 

From: MTC <mtc@mega-auto.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, November 03, 2020 12:25 PM 

To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey <AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: GBJ7174J(AIG) & GBJ6757J on 30/10/2020 

 

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Sirs, 

 

Thanks for the email. 

 

Attached herewith the repair estimate for your kind attention. 

 

 

Thank you 

 

Sarah Chan 

Mega Auto Pte Ltd 

Tel : 8468 9838 Fax : 6458 5884 

 

 

 

From: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey [mailto:AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com]  

Sent: 03 November 2020 11:39 
To: MTC 

Subject: RE: GBJ7174J(AIG) & GBJ6757J on 30/10/2020 

 

Hi Sarah, 

 

Do send in repair estimate if wants to proceed OD claim. 

 

 

Thanks. 

 

AIG Claims Survey 

 

 

 

From: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey  

Sent: Tuesday, November 03, 2020 11:37 AM 

To: MTC <mtc@mega-auto.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] GBJ7174J(AIG) & GBJ6757J on 30/10/2020 
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Hi Sarah, 

 

Mega Auto can undertakes the claim and repair. 

 

 

Thanks. 

 

AIG Claims Survey 

 

 

 

From: MTC <mtc@mega-auto.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, November 03, 2020 10:48 AM 

To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey <AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] GBJ7174J(AIG) & GBJ6757J on 30/10/2020 

 

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Sirs/Mdms, 

 

We’re selected workshop of Federal Express (S) Pte Ltd (GBJ7174J).  

 

Attached herewith the GIA report & Certificate of Insurance. 

 

We seeking for your advice if our client can process  OD claims for this matter?  

Also can Mega Auto undertaking the claims and repairs as client request for it. 

 

We awaiting for your reply. 

 

 

Thank you 

 

Sarah Chan 

Mega Auto Pte Ltd 

Tel : 8468 9838 Fax : 6458 5884 

 

 

 

 

 

 

IMPORTANT NOTICE:  

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 

not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 

"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 

any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 

which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 

responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 

severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 


