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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 6 April 2021 2:58 PM
To: Susan Low
Subject: RE: [OFFER] - GBC6609R (TP) & SHA370G (IV) DOA 26/10/2020    OUR REF: 

D20004382MFSH/CCPL  *** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20011943/Upa3
Attachments: DV_GBC6609R.pdf

Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
Thank you for acceptance. 
  
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return the original signed DV with your client authorisation to act to us 
(LKK) for our necessary action.  
  
For your info, MS FCI need original DV to process payment. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 5 April 2021 9:22 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: [OFFER] - GBC6609R (TP) & SHA370G (IV) DOA 26/10/2020 OUR REF: D20004382MFSH/CCPL *** LKK 
REF: CC4/FCI20011943/Upa3 
 

We hereby confirm acceptance of your offer.  

Kindly let us have your discharge for our client's execution and your cheque made in our favour as soon as possible. 

Thank. 

Best Regards, 
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Susan Low 
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop  
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01  
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit  
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746 
 
 
On Saturday, 3 April 2021, 12:57:39 pm SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:  
 
 
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We propose settlement at a global sum of $4,600.00(all-in). 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, 2 November 2020 5:49 PM 
To: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - GBC6609R (TP) & SHA370G (IV) DOA 26/10/2020 OUR REF: 
D20004382MFSH/CCPL *** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20011943/Upa3  
  
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 
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Please provide us the following. 

 evidence i.e. video and scene photo 
 PIR result (if any) 

  
Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong via email. 
  
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
  
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
  
Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Mei Kwan | Admin  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 
  

From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, October 29, 2020 3:01 PM 
To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: Request for 3rd party claims survey GBC6609R Claims against SHA370G 
  
Accident on 26/10/2020 Along  Boon Lay Way      

Involving  GBC6609R  and  SHA370G      
  
We refer to the above accident and 3rd party claims. 
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We hereby write to request of 3rd party claims pre-repair inspection for our client’s vehicle. 
  

Please let us have your single joint expert motor surveyors list (SJE) to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to 
our client's vehicle jointly with our client/our motor workshop at No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 AutoBay @ Kaki 
Bukit Singapore 417883 as soon as possible. 
  

Kindly arrange. 
 
Thank you. 
  
Best Regard! 
  
Susan Low 
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop 
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 417883 
Tel: 6741 1730 
Fax: 6744 5746 
  

  

Date of Survey:-                     _______________________________________ 
 
Name of Authorise Surveyor:-  _______________________________________ 
 
Surveyor Email:                      _______________________________________ 
 
Remark :-                              _______________________________________ 
  

  


