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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 12:10 PM

To: Jenny Lim; SUR

Subject: RE: GBG 6689M-DOA: 26/10/20 (CHINA TAIPING OD)

Dear Jenny, 

 

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle GBG 6689M, (Excess $ 350.00). 
 
If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 

6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  

 

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company 

before completion of the repair. 

 

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 

 
 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 10:23 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: GBG 6689M 

 

Hi Veron 
 
Can please expedite, owner everyday call and ask when the vehicle ready? 
 
Thank you. 
 
Kind regards. 
 
Jenny Lim 
for LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD 
160 Sin Ming Drive  
#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03 
Sin Ming Autocity 
Singapore 575722 
Tel: 64538110 
Fax: 64596267 
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 10:21 am 
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To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: GBG 6689M 

 

Dear Jenny, 

 

Still pending for approval. 

 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 10:19 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: GBG 6689M 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Veron 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please may I know whether any authorisation to proceed with the repair? 
 
Thank you. 
 
Kind regards. 
 
Jenny Lim 
for LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD 
160 Sin Ming Drive  
#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03 
Sin Ming Autocity 
Singapore 575722 
Tel: 64538110 
Fax: 64596267 
 


