Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 November 2020 9:05 AM
To: Shashitharan; SUR

Subject: FW: SLL 9939C-DOA: 29/10/20
Attachments: 04112020091815-0001.pdf

Dear Shashi,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed $6510.60 before GST @ 6 working days.

Kindly submit Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to GREAT AMERICAN
INSURANCE COMPANY

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 21 November 2020 9:51 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLL 9939C-DOA: 29/10/20

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, November 20, 2020 2:36 PM

To: Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLL 9939C-DOA: 29/10/20

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear ShaShi,
As spoken yesterday.

Kindly forward us finalize.

Best Regards,



Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 November 2020 5:34 PM

To: Shashitharan <shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>
Subject: SLL 9939C-DOA: 29/10/20

Dear ShaShi,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



