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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 31 March 2021 5:32 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Su Li (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving SHD1163R & SLA6191U on 

25.10.2020 - Oref: 20/20/20/VP05/023816  LKK REF : CC4/LPC20011687/Egs3 
[External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Cecilia  
 
Please proceed as per your recommendation 80-20. 
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 4:03 pm 
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving SHD1163R & SLA6191U on 25.10.2020 - Oref: 
20/20/20/VP05/023816 LKK REF : CC4/LPC20011687/Egs3 [External Confidential] 
 
Dear Kenny, 
 
TP reject offer. Propose of 80% settlement. TP reply as follow:  
 
“Your insured reported he had accidently hit our client’s vehicle. Based on the scene video we had provided earlier, 
your insured shows no sign of checking for their blind spot and drove up the slope in a fast speed. Our insured was 
stationary when he saw your insured going up the slope to give way to him. The accident can be prevented if your 
insured had slowed down while turning. Since there is a contrary evidence, BOLA is not applicable for this case. 
 
Solely for amicable settlement, we counter propose settlement at 80%. 
 
Please consider and let us have your reply soonest.” 
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Kindly let us have your approval/instruction to proceed.  
 
Thanks  
 

 

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email:  CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE [mailto:kennylim@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 9 March 2021 12:41 PM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving SHD1163R & SLA6191U on 25.10.2020 - Oref: 
20/20/20/VP05/023816 LKK REF : CC4/LPC20011687/Egs3 [External Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Cecilia  
 
Please proceed accordingly.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 9 March 2021 12:22 pm 
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving SHD1163R & SLA6191U on 25.10.2020 - Oref: 
20/20/20/VP05/023816 LKK REF : CC4/LPC20011687/Egs3 [External Confidential] 
 
Dear Kenny, 
 
Agreed. BOLA S24B apply to this scenario.  
 



3

Has overlook the part “or rounding corner” to “with rounding corner” previously.  
 
In view of above, the revised mandate as follow:  
 

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We have highlighted to your good office on 28/10/2020 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with 
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

 

Bola S24B. Liability based on 50/50. 

 

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD” is as follows: - 

  
Claimed Amount Revised Amount 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 6,820.47 $ 1,498.00 
2. Loss of Rental (4days x $67.41) $ 269.64 $   101.12 (3days x $67.41) 
3. Loss of Income (4days x $100.00) $ 400.00 $    60.00 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 2.00 $      2.00 

Total $ 7,492.11 $ 1,661.12 

**02days recommendation for repair + 1PRS = 3days. 
 
Thanks  
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. 
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, 8 March 2021 6:31 PM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 


