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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Winson Tan <winson_tingwei@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 November 2020 9:57 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: smp 191t after paint done photos 

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Steve..  I confirmed and agree with the finalized offer $5650 for smp 191t..will submit lod to insurance.. 
thanks.. 

Best regards: Winson tan  

Get Outlook for Android 
 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, November 4, 2020 9:53:20 PM 

To: Winson Tan <winson_tingwei@hotmail.com> 

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: smp 191t after paint done photos  

  

Dear Winson, 
  
Kindly refer our finalize $5650 (L/S, before GST). 6 repair days. 
  
Kindly confirm. 
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
Thanks. 
  
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
  
LKK Auto Consultants 
  
Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
  
  
  
  
  


