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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Saturday, 9 April 2022 1:13 PM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: PRI SURVEY OF SLP5266R // LKK Ref: CC4/LPC20011591/Tes3
Attachments: TP ESTIMATE - MARKED (FINAL).pdf

Hi Gerald, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have manage to finalize the case with third party repairer, enclosed the final marked estimate for your easy 
reference. 
 
We will process to submit our wp report & invoice and close off the matter at our end. 
 
Thank You.  
 
Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 7 March 2022 9:24 AM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: PRI SURVEY OF SLP5266R // LKK Ref: CC4/LPC20011591/Tes3 
 
Hi Gerald, 
 
We will check and get back to you. 
 
Hi Asher, 
 
Pls assist. CC4/LPC20011591/Tes3 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, 7 March 2022 8:40 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: PRI SURVEY OF SLP5266R 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
 
Our Ref        : 20/20/20/VC00/023811 
Your Ref      : CC$/LPC20011591/T1ps3 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
The third party had engaged his lawyer to submit the claim. 
 
Please let us know if the repair cost was finalized with the workshop. 
 
If so, please let us have the survey report asap. 
 
Thank you 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 


