Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 23 November, 2020 3:24 PM

To: "tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg'

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: YP6624E-DOA:3/3/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/TP19005999/Epa3qg2-1
Attachments: report.pdf

Categories: HMK

Hi Wei lie,

Amended report for your perusal.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 November, 2020 2:07 PM

To: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP6624E-DOA:3/3/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/TP19005999/Epa3q2-1

Dear Wei Jie,
We refer to our tele-conversation this afternoon.
As spoken, please pay for balance $107.00(with GST).

$107.00 including 2 trips of resurvey and administrative fee.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 29 October, 2020 11:31 AM



To: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg
Subject: RE: YP6624E-DOA:3/3/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/TP19005999/Epa3qg2-1

Dear Wei Jie,

Enclosed.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

From: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg <tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 29 October, 2020 10:56 AM
(‘ch To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>
3 Subject: RE: YP6624E-DOA:3/3/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/TP19005999/Epa3qg2-1
V F I X

QUALITT AUTOMOTIVE

Hi Mei Kwan,

Can you send me an official receipt for the surveyor report from your side?

Thanks & Regards,

Tok Wei Jie

Claim Administrator Cum Purchaser

Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Rental Pte Ltd

26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977

Contact: 6455 2957 | E: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 October 2020 12:38 PM

To: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg

Cc: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao
Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP6624E-DOA:3/3/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/TP19005999/Epa3q2-1

Dear Wei Jie,
Enclosed survey report.

We will send our invoice/ official receipt soonest.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

From: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg <tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 26 October, 2020 10:08 AM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Accounts (LKKAuto)

Nﬁ <account@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP6624E-DOA:3/3/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19005999/Ewa3q2
VvV F I X

QUALITT AUTQOMOTIVE
g

Hi Mei Kwan,

We have passed the cheque to your surveyor last Thursday, may | have the surveyor report by today?

Thanks & Regards,

Tok Wei Jie

Claim Administrator Cum Purchaser

Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Rental Pte Ltd

26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977

Contact: 6455 2957 | E: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg

From: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg <tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 October 2020 1:46 PM

To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg' <wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>;
'Accounts (LKKAuto)' <account@lkkauto.com>; 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

(‘\Cﬁ Subject: RE: YP6624E-DOA:3/3/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19005999/Ewa3q2

VoE T X i Mei Kwan,

QUALITT AUTQOMOTIVE
g

Please find attached for the cheque we issue to you amounting to SGD451.54 related for the surveyor
report.

Thanks & Regards,

Tok Wei Jie

Claim Administrator Cum Purchaser

Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Rental Pte Ltd

26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977

Contact: 6455 2957 | E: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 19 October 2020 4:01 PM

To: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg

Cc: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao
Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP6624E-DOA:3/3/19 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19005999/Ewa3q2

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Our survey report fee is $451.54 (inc. GST).



We will release report after receive payment.

Name of Bank Account LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE
LTD
Name of Bank UOB
Bank - Branch No. 7375 -016
Account No. 116-311-126-3
Email address for remittance advice | account@lkkauto.com
PAYNOW ID 199607198R001
Thank you.
Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

From: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg <tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 19 October, 2020 2:54 PM
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg

C\CJ Hﬂ Subject: YP6624E-DOA:3/3/19

VoFE 12X 4isi/Madam,

QUALITT AUTOMOTIVE
.

May | have the surveyor report for the above-mentioned vehicle and kindly offer with the
price for the report.

Thanks & Regards,

Tok Wei Jie

Claim Administrator Cum Purchaser

Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Rental Pte Ltd

26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977

Contact: 6455 2957 | E: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg




