Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: ying <ying@smemotor.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 21 January 2021 12:55 PM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: YQ 342 - Finalize

hi Steve,

Amount confirmed.
kindly update your offer in merimen system.

thanks & regards
YING
On 21/1/2021 12:51 pm, Steve Chen (LKK Auto) wrote:

Hi Ying,
Kindly refer our finalize $38,000.00 (L/S, Before GST). 20 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Steve| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevechen@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




