Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 23 October 2020 11:51 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: Justin Wong; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Abigail Choo

Subject: FW: PRE REPAIR INSPECTION NOTICE FOR SMP 9149 H | OUR REF: TCMG/SMP
9149 H/1020/WLC ~ YOUR REF: SCL 24 H || C10007680

Attachments: SCL24H.pdf; Ol Statement.PNG; SMP9149H.pdf

Hi Team,

We would like to arrange TP PRS for SMP9149H. TP chose Mr. Marcus Chua to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:
M/s William Lee Car Air Con
No. 1 Soon Lee Road #06-04, Ah Hock@ 9027 0498

Please confirm. Thank you.

Regards,

Ivy Ratilla
Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853
E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
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confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential
and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and
privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

From: Rachel Ling <jin@tcmg.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 23 October 2020 11:30 AM

To: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Claims <claims @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cec: Justin Wong <justin.wong @budgetdirect.com.sg>; lhling@tcmg.com.sg; 'williamleecar lee'
<williamleecar @ gmail.com>

Subject: RE: PRE REPAIR INSPECTION NOTICE FOR SMP 9149 H | OUR REF: TCMG/SMP 9149
H/1020/WLC YOUR REF: SCL 24 H Il C10007680

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Madam,
We refer to the above matter and to your mail of even date.

Our client is agreeable to appoint Mr. Marcus Chua of LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd as the Single Joint Expert.

Regards,
Rachel Ling on behalf of Mr. Ling Leong Hui

From: Customer Care <help @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 23 October 2020 9:49 AM

To: Claims <claims @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: FW: PRE REPAIR INSPECTION NOTICE FOR SMP 9149 H | OUR REF: TCMG/SMP 9149
H/1020/WLC YOUR REF: SCL 24 H

Hi team
PIs assist

Thanks
Fiona

From: Rachel Ling <jin@tcmg.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, October 22, 2020 2:32 PM

To: Customer Care <help @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: 'Ling Leong Hui' <lhling@tcmg.com.sg>; Gerald <gerald @tcmg.com.sg>; calvin@tcmg.com.sg;
'williamleecar lee' <williamleecar @ gmail.com>

Subject: PRE REPAIR INSPECTION NOTICE FOR SMP 9149 H | OUR REF: TCMG/SMP 9149
H/1020/WLC YOUR REF: SCL 24 H

Our Ref: TCMG/SMP 9149 H/1020/WLC
Your Ref: SCL 24 H
Dear Sirs,

PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION NOTICE



We act for Loh Beng San, the owner and/or driver of motor vehicle no. SMP 9149 H, which was involved in an
accident along Upper Bukit Timah Road on 20 October 2020 at 18:15 hrs.

We hereby give you NOTICE that we are claiming against your insured motor vehicle no. SCL 24 H for damages
and/or injuries, costs and disbursements as a result of your insured’s negligence.

Kindly let us know if you wish to conduct a pre-repair inspection on our client’s motor vehicle at M/s William Lee
Car Air Con, (No. 1 Soon Lee Road #06-04, Ah Hock@ 9027 0498).

If we do not hear from you within the next two (2) working days, we shall deem that you have waived the
requirement for the pre-repair inspection.

Regards,
Rachel Ling on behalf of Mr. Ling Leong Hui

TOMMY CHOO, MARK GO LLC
151 Chin Swee Road
#14-15/16 Manhattan House
Singapore 169876

Tel: 6532 2455
Fax: 6538 9850

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services
Pte. Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the
intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated
author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It
may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived
and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended
addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant
that this email is error or virus free.
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