Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Serene LIM <serene@autocare.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 30 October 2020 2:16 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Su Li (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ES3383R & SH8575M ALONG FARRER RD ON 21.10.2020
Attachments: Final Bil $4200.pdf; LOA.pdf; LTA Search.pdf

Hi Cecilia

We are quantifying the below

Cost of repair 4,200
LOU (04 days @ $ 120.00) 480

(Our client engine cap 2672cc. Cat B)

GIA search fee 7.45
TOTAL $4,687.45

Attached supporting documents.

Thank you & await your reply soonest.

Serene LIM

Lim Yew Boo Spray Paint Co

Tel: +65 64545011 | Fax: +65 64593724 | Hp: +65 96852332
E-mail: serene@autocare.com.sg

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 26 October 2020 4:24 pm

To: Serene LIM; Su Li (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ES3383R & SH8575M ALONG FARRER RD ON 21.10.2020

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Serene,

We refer to the above matter
The liability is clear.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”
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LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

TO : M/s LIM YEW BOO SPRAY PAINT CO.
BLK 10, SIN MING IND. EST.
SECTOR C, #01-10, SINGAPORE 575645

We/ I, Mdm Ooi Guat Hua below mentioned person/company, being the registered owner/
driver of Motor Vehicle Registration no. ES3383R involved in an accident on 21/10/2020
involving Motor Vehicle irrevocably authorize you to:-

1)
2)

3)
4)

5)
6)

undertake and proceed with all repairs to the said vehicle ;

thereafter negotiate, claim and/or recover from the adjuster/insurance company/owner
sustained by me/ us

settle and claim, collect and/or received monies pertaining to the claim and to give a valid
receipt thereof as well as to sign discharge vouchers on my/ our behalf

for the purposes above, appoint any solicitors as you deemed fit to act on my/ our behalf}
and

apply all such monies collected or received into account or payment of our repair bills as
well as legal costs and disbursements incurred.

I/' We warrant that all facts and documents furnished to you in support of the claim are true and if

need be

will attend Courts to give evidence in respect thereof, And should any statement of facts

furnished to you be found to be false and you are unable to succeed in the claim, I/We will be
fully responsible for the repair and legal costs incurred.

Name of Vehicle Owner : Mdm Ooi Guat Hua

Motor Vehicle Reg No. : ES3383R

NRIC/ROC No. : Sxxxx334J

Address : C/o Bk 10, Sin Ming Ind. Est. #01-10
Tel No. . 64534177

Signed X\’ :

Company Stamp -

(With Company’s stamp, if applicable)



INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD pi o

& {N DIA
@ Co. Reg, No. 198703792k | GST. Regt, No. M2-0078806-X
o iNTERNATiONAL 64 | Cecil Street | #04 | #05 | #06-02 | I0B Building | Singapore 049711
[nsurance Office (65) 63476100  Email  insure@iii.com.sg
LL:“?,JJ.&?J Fax (65) 62244174 Website www.iil.com.sg

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

lll-Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Ref: MCT20100354
Claimant Ref : ES3383R

we/l, _LIM YEW BOO SPRAY PAINT CO. ("the workshop") hereby confirm that we/l have reached an agreement

with the appointed Surveyor of India International Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name
of Surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S$_4,200.00 (repair cost), S$__480.00 (loss of
use/rertal), S§ 7.45 (search fee), vehicle no. ES3383R__ that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred
on_21/10/2020 _ (date) at FARRER ROAD (location) involving vehicle no. SH8575M (insured

vehicle). This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on _28/10/2020  (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/fam authorized by the owner OO0l GUAT HUA ("the third party
claimant") of vehicle no. ES3383R to make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle
the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by "the third

party claimant".

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify India International Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, loss and/or expense that
they will or have already incurred in the event that "the third party claimant" after the above said agreement lodges a
further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining to cost of repairs and/or rental and/or loss
of use pursuant to the damage to ES3383R __ (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

pursuant to the accident and that further this settiement is reached. on a without prejudice and without admission of liability

basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over any
dispute arising out ofthe same.

Wel/l authorize youto pay the total amountof S$_4,687.45 _ to __ LIM YEW BOO SPRAY PAINT CO.

!
We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of all claims of "the third party claimant”

Dated this 02..... day of .....December. 20 20
CLAIMANT: éé 7 WITNESS:
Signature: Signature: | <X
Signed by "the workshop" (with chop) Signed bfapﬁoiﬁ’t'ed Surveyor

Name: Serene Lim Name: LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
NRIC: S7346864G NRIC: 199607 198R
Address: Blk 10 Sin Ming Ind Est #01-10 , Address: 51 UBI AVE 1 #02-25

Sector C Spore 575721 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK S(408933)
Nationality: Singaporean Nationality:

Occupation: Admin Occupation:




LIM YEW BOO SPRAY PAINT CO.

BLK 10, SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE, SECTOR C,#01-10 $'575645
NO. 176, SIN MING DRIVE, #03-05, SIN MING AUTOCARE, S'PORE 575721
Tel No. : 64534177 Fax No. : 64593724

E-Mail : limyewboo@singnet.com.sg

Website : www.limyewboo.com.sg

Buss. Reg. No. : 200514/00L

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD i i il -
B O STREET 0860 Final Repair Bill : TP20/036
|OB BUILDING SINGAPORE 049711 Date : 30/10/2020
Vehicle Num. : ES 3383R
. . Make/Model : LEXUS RX 270-2012
Attention : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng# - JTJZA11A302018933/1AR0776588
Contact : 63476100 Fax No. : 62244174 Accident Date : 21/10/2020
Claim No. :
Reference : LYB/ES3383R/Ill/tp/s|
Policy No. :
Amount S$
LUMP SUM 4,200.00
E. & O.E. Total S$ . 4,200.00

for CIM_YEW BOO SPRAY PAINT CO.



Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-201021-003238
Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference
No.
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SH8575M
As at 21 Oct 2020/16:18:00
Insurance Co: INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SH8575M
Enquiry Fee
20201021175311092747

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Print Date/Time :

Receipt Date/Time :

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Sub-Total

Total Before Rounding
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable
Paid By
540188XXXXXX1125
Total

Cash Change
Tendered Amount

Excess Refundable Amount

Amount GST
Before Amount
GST (S%) (S9%)
7.00 0.49

7.00 0.49

7.00 0.49

eNETS Credit Card

21 Oct 2020/ 17:54:21
21 Oct 2020/ 17:54:16

Amount
After GST
(S9)

7.49

7.49
7.49
0.04
7.45

7.45
7.45
0.00
7.45
0.00

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



12/2/2020 Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*ES3383R (MCT20100354)
[SH8575M]
TP
OOl GUAT HUA
Oct 21 2020 4:00PM
[-]
Lim Yew Boo Spray Paint Co

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (llI_SG), sent on 26/11/2020 10:15 AM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$4687.45) - ES3383R - Claim Handler: Priya

Approved:4687.45.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print& CFID=79834881&CFTOKEN=1de2d91b34a9f818-49E94F... 1/1



