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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Siti <siti@tecrevox.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 29 October 2020 7:27 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Ong KB; nick@tecrevox.com.sg
Subject: Fwd: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 1704P(AIG) AND SJN 6835B AT/ALONG 18 

KAKI BUKIT RD 3 BASEMENT CARPARK ON 21/10/2020

Hi Ms Chew, 
 
Please refer to the below email as per for the pictures and the timing of the accident. 
 
Regards  

Siti 

 
 
-------- Forwarded Message --------  
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 1704P(AIG) AND SJN 6835B AT/ALONG 18 KAKI BUKIT RD 3 BASEMENT 

CARPARK ON 21/10/2020 
Date: Thu, 29 Oct 2020 17:48:03 +0800 
From: Nick Lee <nick@tecrevox.com.sg> 

To: Siti <siti@tecrevox.com.sg> 
CC: Ong KB <kbong@tecrevox.com.sg> 

 

Hi Siti 
 
Is 7pm in the evening .  
 
Attached is the Photo.  
 
Thanks  
 
Best Regards, 
Nick Lee  
Operation Manager  
Tec Revox Engineering Pte Ltd 
18 Kaki Bukit Road 3 #03-12 
Entrepreneur Business Centre 
Singapore 415978 
Hp: 91000372 
Tel : 6481 6288 
Fax : 6481 6280 
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To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avast.com  

 
On Thu, Oct 29, 2020 at 12:36 PM Siti <siti@tecrevox.com.sg> wrote: 

HI Nick, 

Reference to the above subject, the insurance company has request us their enquiries as mentioned in the below 
email. 
 
Please assist to check with Edwin on the enquiries as highlighted in YELLOW. 

Regards 
Siti 

 
 
-------- Forwarded Message --------  
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 1704P(AIG) AND SJN 6835B AT/ALONG 18 KAKI BUKIT RD 3 BASEMENT CARPARK 

ON 21/10/2020 
Date: Thu, 29 Oct 2020 04:29:47 +0000 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

To: siti@tecrevox.com.sg <siti@tecrevox.com.sg> 
 

29 Oct 2020                                                                       

                                                                

M/S TEC REVOX ENGINEERING PTE LTD                                                 [By Email Only] 

  

Dear Ms Siti, 

  

You Ref: GBK1704P 

Our Ref: CC4/AIG20011477/Epa3 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 1704P(AIG) AND SJN 6835B AT/ALONG 18 KAKI BUKIT RD 3 BASEMENT CARPARK ON 
21/10/2020 

  

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your 
motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 

  

We have received a claim from SJN6835B against your insurance policy. 
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Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your driver’s favour as he reversed and 
collided onto third party parked vehicle. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with 
the Third Party. 

  

As per our tele-conversation earlier, kindly assist to check/confirm with your driver on the following: - 

  

 Time of Accident (7am or 7pm). 
 Any scene photos taken by him. If yes, please submit a copy to us. 

  

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

  

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third Party 
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD 
will be protected. 

  

Please call us if you have further queries. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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