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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: kennychan@alanutd.com

Sent: Tuesday, 29 December 2020 12:45 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: ACC INV SKB 6128K AND SML 2181E ON 16.10.2020 *** LKK REF : 

CC6/CTI20011463/Kda3 ENCLOSED SIGNED DV 

Attachments: KM_206_201229123859.pdf

Hi Jaslin  

 
Enclosed signed DV for your attention ,original copy will be posted out to your office ,thank you . 

 
Regards  
Kenny  
Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd  
64538686 

 

 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, December 29, 2020 8:58 AM 

To: Shi Jie <shijie@alanutd.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; kennychan@alanutd.com 

Subject: RE: ACC INV SKB 6128K AND SML 2181E ON 16.10.2020 *** LKK REF : CC6/CTI20011463/Kda3  

 
Without Prejudice 

 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

 
We refer to the above matter. 

 
We confirm settlement as per your LOD. 

 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 3,745.00 

2. Loss of Rental (3 days x $120.00)  $ 360.00  

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 2.00 

Total $  4,107.00 

 
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return it in colour to us(LKK) for our necessary action. 

 
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Shi Jie <shijie@alanutd.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 22 October 2020 3:46 PM 

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; kennychan@alanutd.com 

Subject: RE: ACC INV SKB 6128K AND SML 2181E ON 16.10.2020 *** LKK REF : CC6/CTI20011463/Kda3  

 

Hi Mei Kwan, 

 

Noted with thanks. 

 

 

Regards, 

 

Shi Jie 

Alan’s United Auto Pte. Ltd. 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, October 22, 2020 3:45 PM 

To: Shi Jie <shijie@alanutd.com> 

Cc: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; kennychan@alanutd.com 

Subject: RE: ACC INV SKB 6128K AND SML 2181E ON 16.10.2020 *** LKK REF : CC6/CTI20011463/Kda3  

 
Hi Shi Jie, 

 
Just received the video from Kenneth. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

 

From: Shi Jie <shijie@alanutd.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 22 October, 2020 3:43 PM 

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; kennychan@alanutd.com 

Subject: RE: ACC INV SKB 6128K AND SML 2181E ON 16.10.2020 *** LKK REF : CC6/CTI20011463/Kda3  

 

Hi Meikwan,  

 

Please refer to the attached for your action. 

 

Video might be too big to be sent via email. Can I use wetransfer to send it to you? 

 

 

Regards, 

 

Shi Jie 

Alan’s United Auto Pte. Ltd. 



3

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, October 22, 2020 3:34 PM 

To: Shi Jie <shijie@alanutd.com> 

Cc: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; kennychan@alanutd.com 

Subject: RE: ACC INV SKB 6128K AND SML 2181E ON 16.10.2020 *** LKK REF : CC6/CTI20011463/Kda3  

 
Hi Shi Jie, 

 
He only provides me 3 pages. No police report. Unable to submit to insurace. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

 

From: Shi Jie <shijie@alanutd.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 22 October, 2020 12:47 PM 

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; kennychan@alanutd.com 

Subject: RE: ACC INV SKB 6128K AND SML 2181E ON 16.10.2020 *** LKK REF : CC6/CTI20011463/Kda3  

 

Hi Meikwan, 

 

Kenny had pass the below documents to Kenneth.  

 

You may get them from Kenneth accordingly. Thank you.  

 

 

Regards, 

 

Shi Jie 

Alan’s United Auto Pte. Ltd. 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, October 21, 2020 7:01 PM 

To: shijie@alanutd.com 

Cc: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: ACC INV SKB 6128K AND SML 2181E ON 16.10.2020 *** LKK REF : CC6/CTI20011463/Kda3  

 
Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please provide us the following. 

o evidence i.e. video and scene photo 

o PIR result (if any) 
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o GIA / police report 

  

Our respective case handler, Jia Le will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

 


