Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 17 November 2020 2:59 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident report for SJE5918A

Attachments: Marked estimate.pdf; 1adbcd4b-edf1-4552-8e5b-8272ed644606.jpg;

9d8bc17a-0277-4d78-a222-ce078b3e7b5f.jpg; 65acbbd4-86e3-4bf1-
b1e1-18d68d50ad8c.jpg; 705a6999-ff62-49a5-9006-06d28bc264c2.jpg; 9383aaff-
cf47-4d55-bbab-1710ae1e7db4.jpg; 59296747-3072-4b9%a-8a98-9a46497d4027 jpg;
€928fcba-8064-499f-adf8-c5128fcd69ea.jpg

Hi Taufikh,

r& Please find attached marked estimate and after repair photo.
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We accept $5,000 and 7 days.

Thanks & Regards,

Tok Wei Jie

Claim Administrator Cum Purchaser

Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Rental Pte Ltd

26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977

Contact: 6455 2957 | E: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 17 November 2020 11:15 AM

To: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg

Cc: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Accident report for SJE5918A

Hi Wei lJie,
Repair limit $5000. Please forward after repair for this vehicle, thank you.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg [mailto:tokwj@vfixauto.com.sq]
Sent: Thursday, 5 November 2020 10:51 AM

To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)'

Cc: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: Accident report for SJE5918A

Hi Taufikh,
Thank you for your email.
However, we would like to make a counter offer of SGD5,000.

Appreciate if you can respond to us as soonest possible.
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Thanks & Regards,

Tok Wei Jie

Claim Administrator Cum Purchaser
Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Rental Pte Ltd
26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977
Contact: 6455 2957 | E: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 26 October 2020 10:38 PM

To: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg

Cc: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: Accident report for SJE5918A

Hi,
Please take note repair limit for this car is $4500.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg [mailto:tokwj@vfixauto.com.sq]
Sent: Monday, 26 October 2020 10:34 AM
To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)'
Cc: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg
Subject: Accident report for SJE5918A

Hi Taufikh,

Please attached the accident report as per requested.

Thanks & Regards,

Tok Wei Jie

Claim Administrator Cum Purchaser

Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Rental Pte Ltd

26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977

Contact: 6455 2957 | E: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg
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