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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 April 2021 3:37 PM

To: Jacelyn

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: SDV169J - TP/CHINA TAIPING - BMW 330I (DOA 10.10.2020)

Hi Jacelyn, 

 

Finalised amount of $ 2,263.35 / 3 days of part by part repair is confirmed 

 
Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Jacelyn [mailto:jacelyn@mova.com.sg]  
Sent: Thursday, 22 April, 2021 3:31 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Subject: FINALIZATION: SDV169J - TP/CHINA TAIPING - BMW 330I (DOA 10.10.2020) 

 

Dear Rasul, 

 

Please find the attached ‘Marking Estimate’ & ‘After-Paint’ photographs for your reference.  

 

We propose the finalize amount at Part-By-Part $ 2,263.35 with 3 working days. Kindly revert. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Jacelyn Ooi 
Estimator 
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314 
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