Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Dd hashim <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 24 December 2020 11:16 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Kelly Ding

Subject: Re: 50112885/SHA8041D/TP SHB2313D/19/10/2020-OFFER/REF:
Attachments: CCF_001943.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Jaslin,

Attached signed dv and tax invoice for payment process.
You may proceed with the payment.
Thank you.

Keep clean Stay Safe
SINCERELY

DD HASHIM

Motor Claims Officer

HP:+65 81160811/+65 92394128

Virus-free. www.avast.com

On Mon, Dec 21, 2020 at 10:26 AM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote:
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for acceptance.

Please duly sign the Discharge Receipt enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Dd hashim <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Monday, 21 December 2020 10:04 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Kelly Ding <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>
Subject: Re: 50112885/SHA8041D/TP SHB2313D/19/10/2020-OFFER/REF:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Morning Jaslin,

Offer accepted.Kindly send me DV for payment process.
Thank you.

Keep clean Stay Safe
SINCERELY

DD HASHIM

Motor Claims Officer

HP:+65 81160811/+65 92394128

On Fri, Dec 18, 2020 at 3:15 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com> wrote:
Your Ref: SHA 8041D

LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20011420/T1ra3q2 Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 2313D AND SHA 8041D ON 19/10/2020

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $2,086.50

2. Loss of Rental (2 days x $103.43) (w/GST) $206.86

3. Loss of Income (2 days x $50.00) $100.00

4. LTA Search Fee $7.45
Total | $2,400.81

Please confirm acceptance.
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Dd hashim [mailto:dd.hashim@dingauto.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 3:27 PM




To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Cc: Kelly Ding; taxiscs
Subject: 50112885/SHA8041D/TP SHB2313D/19/10/2020-OFFER/REF:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
DING AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
Dear lJiale,

Attachment our supporting documents to claim against your insured.
We have completed the repair,vehicle collected and have finalized.

We would like to claim for our client as per following:
Recommended Repair Days: 03
Sat,Sun,Public Holiday/etc: 00
Total Claims Days: 03

Cost Of Repair: $2,086.50
Lta/Gia Fee:$7.45

Loss Of Rental: $310.29

Loss Of Income: $240.00
Towing Fee: $0.00

Surveyor Fee: $0.00
Total:$2,644.24

Kindly revert us with an offer to close this case as soon as possible.
Please do not hesitate to contact us for further assistance.

Thank you.
~Keep Clean,Stay Safe~
SINCERELY

DD HASHIM
HP:+65 81160811/+65 92394128

[x] ¥ Virus-free. www.avast.com




