Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Hi Team

Abigail Choo <abigail.choo@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Wednesday, 21 October, 2020 9:58 AM

admin-d@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Justin Wong; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

FW: Accident involved SLW8542L & SLR4168L ( BD ) on 16/10/20//C10007644KY
SLW8542L.pdf; SLR4168L.pdf; ESTIMATE.pdf

Kindly requests TP PRS for vehicle SLW8542L.

Workshop details:

160 Sin Ming Drive #06-03.

Our Client’s Vehicle Number:

SLW8542L CAR-IN

BD Vehicle Number:

SLR4168L

Date/Time of Loss:

16/10/2020 08:05 hr

Please contact Eryx Tan @ 8138 7188 for the survey arrangement.

Regards,

Abigail Choo
Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853

E abigail.choo@budgetdirect.com.sg

Flatinum

Budget &
. Direct o
insurance

Customer Care +65 6221 2111

Claims +65 6221 2199

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01

Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924
budgetdirect.com.sg

From: Abigail Choo

Sent: Tuesday, 20 October 2020 11:30 am



To: admin-delkkauto.com, <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; admin-delkkauto.com, <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Justin Wong <justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok <derrick.g@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim
<kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Accident involved SLW8542L & SLR4168L ( BD ) on 16/10/20//C10007644KY

Hi Team
Kindly requests TP PRS for vehicle SLW8542L.

Workshop details:
160 Sin Ming Drive #06-03.

Our Client’s Vehicle Number: | SLW8542L CAR-IN
BD Vehicle Number: SLR4168L
Date/Time of Loss: 16/10/2020 08:05 hr

Please contact Eryx Tan @ 8138 7188 for the survey arrangement.

Regards,

Abigail Choo
Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853
E abiqgail.choo@budgetdirect.com.sg

Flatinum

BquEtt
1rec mom—
insurance

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.sg

From: eryx.tan@mbmwheelpower.com.sg <eryx.tan@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 19 October 2020 5:22 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: danny.ong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg

Subject: Accident involved SLW8542L & SLR4168L ( BD ) on 16/10/20




Dear All,

Hereby attached the GIA report & Estimate.

Kindly advise on the liability status & arrange for the below survey at
160 Sin Ming Drive #06-03.

Our Client’s Vehicle Number: | SLW8542L CAR-IN
BD Vehicle Number: SLR4168L
Date/Time of Loss: 16/10/2020 08:05 hr

Please contact Eryx Tan @ 8138 7188 for the survey arrangement.

Thank you & Best regards

Eryx Tan | Claim Advisor
ff'nﬁ‘; mbm
= DARE TO BT

6262 8888 | IF 6452 5333 | M 8138 7188

Email: eryx.tan@mbmwheelpower.com.sg
MBM Wheelpower Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive  #06-02

Sin Ming AutoCity * Singapore 575722

www.mbmwheelpower.com.sg
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views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the
intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure
of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then
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