Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 5:37 PM

To: Shashitharan PTCBC; Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SLV 3948M FINAL BILL

Dear Shashi,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Noted with thanks.

Kindly submit Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to CHINA TAIPING.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 4:57 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLV3948M FINAL BILL

Hi we accept the final amount of $16,759.90 before GST @ 8 working days

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, November 2, 2020 3:01 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@I|kkauto.com>; Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>
Subject: FW: SLV3948M FINAL BILL

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Shashi,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Finalize amount can confirm?

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 29 October 2020 2:35 PM

To: Shashitharan <shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SLV3948M FINAL BILL

Dear Shashi,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Refer to your final bill.

For items no.25 and no 33 is repeat item, we will take out 1 item of $761.40
Finalize amount of $16,759.90 before GST @ 8 working days.

Kindly check and confirmed.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 October 2020 12:01 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SLV3948M FINAL BILL

From: Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, October 27, 2020 11:59 AM

To: Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>

Subject: SLV3948M FINAL BILL

Sent by: [Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg]
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