Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 31 December 2020 2:12 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Claims

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD2010-043--Accident involving SHD6300P (FCIL) & SHD9651X on
09.10.20

Attachments: AAD2010-043 - DV.pdf

Without prejudice

Dear Jaslin
Attach duly signed DV for your action.
Hope to receive your payment soon.

*Due to COVID-19 virus, all correspondence will be by way of email only. Please let me know if you need the original
signature copy of the documents.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct
of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 28 December, 2020 3:02 PM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD2010-043--Accident involving SHD6300P (FCIL) & SHD9651X on 09.10.20

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.



We confirm settlement as per your LOD.

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) S 695.50
2. Loss of Rental (2days x $96.30)(w/GST) S 192.60
3. Loss of Income (2days x $50.00) $ 100.00

Total | $ 988.10

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return it in colour to us(LKK) for our necessary action.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 23 November 2020 1:49 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: TCS REF: AAD2010-043--Accident involving SHD6300P (FCIL) & SHD9651X on 09.10.20

Without prejudice

Dear Sir

We are making a claim against your client SHD 6300P.

Enclosed is our LOD for your perusal and action.

Please advise your offering soon so that we can expedite and process the claim.

*Due to COVID-19 virus, all correspondence will be by way of email only. Please let me know if you need the original
signature copy of the documents.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct
of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111



Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764



